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2022 Ford F-250 Super Duty XLT 4x4
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Our Price $46,977
Specifications:

Year:  2022  

VIN:  1FT8W2BT3NEE81716  

Make:  Ford  

Stock:  E81716  

Model/Trim:  F-250 Super Duty XLT 4x4  

Condition:  Pre-Owned  

Body:  Pickup Truck  

Exterior:  [Z1] Oxford White  

Engine:  Power Stroke 6.7L Biodiesel Turbo V8
475hp 1050ft. lbs.

 

Interior:  Medium Earth Gray Cloth  

Transmission:  10-Speed Shiftable Automatic  

Mileage:  44,743  

Drivetrain:  4 Wheel Drive

2022 Ford F-250 Super Duty XLT 4x4 Get ready to command the road
with the 2022 Ford F-250 Super Duty XLT 4x4, a powerhouse of
performance and luxury wrapped in a sleek, white exterior. This truck
doesn't just look the part; it plays it with authority, thanks to its
formidable Power Stroke 6.7L Biodiesel Turbo V8 engine that churns
out an astounding 475hp and 1050ft. lbs. of torque. Whether you're
towing, hauling, or off-roading, this beast is engineered to handle it all
with ease and precision. Stay connected and entertained on the go with
the SiriusXM Satellite Radio, which includes a 5-year prepaid
subscription to SiriusXM Traffic and Travel Link. Never miss a beat with
real-time updates, making your journeys as enjoyable as they are
efficient. The black platform running boards add a touch of rugged
elegance while ensuring easy access to the cab. Conquer any terrain
with the LT275/70R18E BSW All-Terrain Tires, including a robust all-
terrain spare tire. The Tough Bed Spray-In Bedliner with tailgate guard,
black box bed tie down hooks, and black bed attachment bolts ensures
that your truck bed remains in pristine condition, no matter the load. The
FX4 Off-Road Package carries hill descent control, transfer case and
fuel tank skid plates, off-road tuned shocks, making this truck ready for
any off-road challenge. This F-250 shall now be known as "Tow King",
thanks in large part to the Trailer Tow High Capacity package, featuring
the Ultimate Trailer Tow Camera System and Pro Trailer Backup Assist.
This includes an increased GCW on the diesel engine from 23,500 lbs.
to 30,000 lbs., a 360-degree camera system, LED CHMSL with camera,
Pro Trailer Backup Assist, and lane-keeping alert. Whether you're
towing a boat, trailer, or heavy equipment, this truck has you covered.
The 3.55 Electronic Locking Axle Ratio and 397 Amp Alternator ensure
that this truck is as reliable as it is powerful. The upfitter switches
located in the overhead console provide added convenience,
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Installed Options

Interior

- Air filtration - Power outlet(s): 12V front  - Clock - Digital odometer 

- External temperature display - Powertrain hour meter  - Rear seat folding: folds up  

- Rear seat type: 60-40 split bench

Exterior

- Tailgate: lift assist - Towing mirrors - Spare wheel type: steel  

- Tire Pressure Monitoring System - Front wipers: variable intermittent 

- Solar-tinted glass: front
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