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Our Price $49,995
Retail Value $54,995

Specifications:

Year:  2021  

VIN:  1C6RREFT0MN660602  

Make:  Ram  

Stock:  A000339  

Model/Trim:  Lifted 6" Big Horn Night Edition Crew Cab  

Condition:  Pre-Owned  

Body:  Pickup Truck  

Exterior:  Diamond Black Crystal Pearlcoat  

Engine:  HEMI 5.7L V8 395hp 410ft. lbs.  

Interior:  Black Cloth  

Transmission:  8-Speed Shiftable Automatic  

Mileage:  37,755  

Drivetrain:  Rear Wheel Drive  

Economy:  City 15 / Highway 22

Are you ready to elevate your driving experience to new heights? Feast
your eyes on the stunning 2021 Ram 1500 Big Horn! This powerhouse
of a truck combines rugged capability with refined comfort, making it the
ultimate vehicle for both work and play. With only 37,755 miles on the
odometer, this beauty is just getting started!

Dressed to impress in a sleek black exterior, the Ram 1500 Big Horn
commands attention wherever it goes. The bold chrome front bumper
adds a touch of sophistication, while the active grille shutters enhance
aerodynamics and fuel efficiency. And when the sun dips below the
horizon, the front fog lights and exterior entry lights with approach lamps
ensure you have a clear view of the road ahead.

Step inside, and you'll be greeted by a spacious and inviting cabin
adorned in black cloth upholstery. The interior is designed with your
comfort in mind, offering ample space for you and your passengers to
stretch out and relax. The intuitive Uconnect infotainment system,
featuring a 5-inch screen, keeps you connected and entertained on the
go. With six speakers, speed-sensitive volume control, and a radio data
system, your favorite tunes will sound better than ever.

Under the hood, the Ram 1500 Big Horn boasts a formidable HEMI
5.7L V8 engine, delivering an impressive 395 horsepower and 410 lb-ft
of torque. Paired with an 8-speed shiftable automatic transmission, this
truck offers smooth and responsive performance, whether you're
cruising down the highway or tackling tough terrain. The lift-assist
tailgate and pickup bed light make loading and unloading cargo a
breeze, while the daytime running lights enhance visibility and safety.

But that's not all! The Ram 1500 Big Horn is packed with advanced
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But that's not all! The Ram 1500 Big Horn is packed with advanced
technology to keep you connected and in control. The wireless
Bluetooth data link and voice-operated hands-free phone call integration
allow you to stay connected without taking your hands off the wheel.
The electronic messaging assistance ensures you never miss an
important message, even when you're on the go.

When it comes to accolades, the 2021 Ram 1500 Big Horn is no
stranger to praise. It has earned top marks in J.D. Power and
Associates's Vehicle Dependability Study (VDS) and Initial Quality
Study (IQS), solidifying its reputation as a reliable and high-quality
vehicle. You can drive with confidence, knowing that this truck has been
recognized for its outstanding performance and dependability.

In summary, the 2021 Ram 1500 Big Horn is a perfect blend of power,
style, and technology. Whether you're hauling heavy loads, embarking
on an off-road adventure, or simply commuting to work, this truck is
designed to meet your needs and exceed your expectations. Don't miss
your chance to own this exceptional vehicle – it's time to experience the
thrill of driving a Ram 1500 Big Horn for yourself!

Visit us today and take this remarkable truck for a test drive. Feel the
power of the HEMI engine, enjoy the comfort of the black cloth interior,
and discover why the Ram 1500 Big Horn is a top choice for drivers
who demand the best. Your next adventure awaits – get behind the
wheel of the 2021 Ram 1500 Big Horn and make every drive an
unforgettable experience!
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Vehicle History Report : as Of 09/08/2024

*carfax Snapshot is a reflection of available information on the date the report was pulled. carfax
is constantly being updated with new information and is subject to change at any time.

 

Our Location :
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Installed Options

Interior

- Front air conditioning  - Rear vents: second row - Dash trim: alloy - Door trim: alloy 

- Shift knob trim: alloy  - Steering wheel trim: leather - Capless fuel filler system 

- Cruise control - Footwell lights - Multi-function remote: keyless entry 

- Power outlet(s): 12V front  - Power steering - Push-button start 

- Steering wheel: tilt and telescopic  - Clock - Compass - Digital odometer 

- External temperature display - Multi-function display - Powertrain hour meter  

- Trip odometer - Front seat type: 40-20-40 split bench  - Rear seat folding: folds up  

- Rear seat type: 60-40 split bench  - Upholstery: cloth

Exterior

- Active grille shutters - Front bumper color: chrome - Pickup bed light - Tailgate: lift assist 

- Daytime running lights  - Exterior entry lights: approach lamps  - Front fog lights  

- Side mirrors: heated  - Spare wheel type: steel  - Tire Pressure Monitoring System 

- Wheels: aluminum alloy - Front wipers: variable intermittent 

- Laminated glass: acoustic windshield  - Power windows: safety reverse  

- Rear privacy glass - Solar-tinted glass

Snapshot

2021 RAM 1500 BIG HORN

Damage reported: minor damage

MINOR MODERATE SEVERE

1 Service history
record

At least 1 open
recall

2 Previous owners

37,755 Last reported odometer
reading

FREE CARFAX Report

See the full CARFAX Report for additional information
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