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Our Price $49,988
Specifications:

Year:  2021  

VIN:  1FT7W2BT6MED55585  

Make:  Ford  

Stock:  D55585  

Model/Trim:  F-250 Super Duty Lariat 4x4  

Condition:  Pre-Owned  

Body:  Pickup Truck  

Exterior:  [Z1] Oxford White  

Engine:  Power Stroke 6.7L Biodiesel Turbo V8
475hp 1050ft. lbs.

 

Interior:  Black Leather  

Transmission:  10-Speed Shiftable Automatic  

Mileage:  91,205  

Drivetrain:  4 Wheel Drive

2021 Ford F-250 Super Duty Lariat 4x4 The 2021 Ford F-250 Super
Duty Lariat 4x4 is a testament to Ford's undying devotion to building the
best truck's in the world. With it's world-beating Power Stroke 6.7L
Biodiesel Turbo V8 engine at the helm, the F-250 can do just about
anything you ask of it. Step inside to be greeted by the plush black
leather interior, promising unparalleled comfort and style for every
journey. Stay ahead of the curve with the cutting-edge voice-activated
navigation system, complete with a 5-year pre-paid subscription to
SiriusXM Traffic and Travel Link. Never miss a beat with the integrated
Wi-Fi hotspot, ensuring you and your passengers stay connected on the
go. The seamless smartphone integration with Android Auto lets you
access your favorite apps, music, and more, right from the intuitive
infotainment system. Equipped with automatic emergency braking, a
pre-collision warning system, and lane deviation sensors, you can drive
with confidence knowing that you're protected by the latest in
automotive safety technology. The blind spot safety system and rear
cross traffic alert add an extra layer of security, making every drive as
safe as it is enjoyable. Enhance your driving experience with the
premium Bang & Olufsen sound system, delivering 1000 watts of pure
audio bliss. The aluminum alloy wheels with painted accents not only
add a touch of elegance but also provide robust performance on any
terrain. The 6-inch chrome angular extended running boards offer both
style and functionality, making it easy to step in and out of this
magnificent truck. The Tough Bed spray-in bedliner, complete with a
tailgate guard, black box bed tie-down hooks, and black bed attachment
bolts, ensures that your truck bed remains in pristine condition, no
matter what you haul. The Equipment Group 608A package includes all
the essential standard equipment, making this truck ready for any
adventure right out of the box. Don't miss your chance to own this
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Installed Options

Interior

- Air filtration - Power outlet(s): 12V front  - Clock - Digital odometer 

- External temperature display - Powertrain hour meter  - Rear seat folding: folds up  

- Rear seat type: 60-40 split bench

Exterior

- Tailgate: lift assist - Towing mirrors - Spare wheel type: steel  

- Tire Pressure Monitoring System - Front wipers: variable intermittent 

- Solar-tinted glass: front
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