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Our Price $42,988
Specifications:

Year:  2019  

VIN:  1GT12REY8KF273530  

Make:  GMC  

Stock:  273530  

Model/Trim:  Sierra 2500HD SLT  

Condition:  Pre-Owned  

Body:  Pickup Truck  

Exterior:  [G7C] Cardinal Red  

Engine:  Duramax 6.6L Biodiesel Turbo V8 445hp
910ft. lbs.

 

Interior:  Jet Black Leather  

Transmission:  Allison 1000 6-Speed Shiftable Automatic  

Mileage:  120,864  

Drivetrain:  4 Wheel Drive

2019 GMC Sierra 2500HD SLT 4x4 This 2019 GMC Sierra 2500HD SLT
4x4 is everything you could want in a truck, durable, reliable, capable
and sophisticated. Step inside to find a refined black leather interior that
dishes out serious comfort and swagger. Under the hood, the Sierra
2500HD SLT boasts the formidable Duramax 6.6L Biodiesel Turbo V8
engine and Allison 1000 6-speed transmission, a combination that
belongs in the hall of fame for all the good it's done in the world. The
Bose Premium Speaker System with six speakers envelops you in
crystal-clear sound, making every journey more enjoyable. The Full
Feature Leather-Appointed Front Bucket Seats offer heated and vented
cushions and seat backs, 10-way power adjusters, and memory settings
for ultimate comfort and convenience. For those who demand versatility
and ease of use, the Sierra 2500HD SLT delivers. The Power
Adjustable Vertical Trailering Mirrors, with their heated, power-folding,
and memory features, make towing a breeze. The Spray-On Bed Liner
protects your truck bed from scratches and dents, while the Power Rear
Sliding Window with rear defogger adds convenience and functionality.
The custom wheels and all-terrain tires make sure that all four contact
points for this truck are well prepared for anything the world throws at
you. Stay connected on the go with the built-in Wi-Fi hotspot, and never
forget your precious cargo with the Check Rear Seat Reminder. The
Sierra 2500HD SLT is available AS-IS, with extended warranty options
for added peace of mind. Come in for a test drive today and experience
the Sierra difference for yourself! This vehicle has been reduced at
below wholesale prices. READY for work and play! Give us a call today!
Can't make it in? We offer shipping all over the United States. Ask your
salesperson for shipping quotes. Financing is available with competitive
rates! Get pre-approved in no time by filling out a credit application on
the finance section of our website! We
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Installed Options

Interior

- Air filtration - Front air conditioning: automatic climate control  

- Front air conditioning zones: dual  - Floor mat material: carpet - Floor mats: front 

- Steering wheel trim: leather - Adjustable pedals: power - Capless fuel filler system 

- Cruise control - Memorized settings: 2 driver - Multi-function remote: keyless entry 

- Power outlet(s): 115V front  - Power steering: variable/speed-proportional 

- Rearview mirror: auto-dimming - Remote engine start - Steering wheel: tilt and telescopic  

- Universal remote transmitter: garage door opener  - Clock - Digital odometer 

- External temperature display - Multi-function display - Powertrain hour meter  

- Trip odometer - Driver seat: heated  - Driver seat power adjustments: 10  

- Front seat type: 40-20-40 split bench  - Passenger seat: heated  

- Passenger seat power adjustments: 10  - Rear seat folding: folds up  

- Rear seat type: 60-40 split bench  - Upholstery: leather-trimmed

Exterior

- Body side moldings: chrome - Door handle color: chrome - Front bumper color: chrome 

- Mirror color: chrome - Pickup bed light: LED - Tailgate: lift assist 

- Daytime running lights: LED - Exterior entry lights: puddle lamps  - Front fog lights  

- Side mirror adjustments: power - Side mirrors: driver side auto-dimming 

- Spare wheel type: steel  - Tire Pressure Monitoring System 

- Wheels: chrome aluminum alloy - Front wipers: variable intermittent 

- Power windows: safety reverse  - Tinted glass - Window defogger: rear
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