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Our Price $20,988
Specifications:

Year:  2014  

VIN:  1C6RR7MTXES420149  

Make:  Ram  

Stock:  420149  

Model/Trim:  1500 Sport  

Condition:  Pre-Owned  

Body:  Pickup Truck  

Exterior:  [PCL] Blue Streak Pearl Coat  

Engine:  HEMI 5.7L V8 395hp 407ft. lbs.  

Interior:  Black Cloth  

Transmission:  8-Speed Shiftable Automatic  

Mileage:  140,633  

Drivetrain:  4 Wheel Drive  

Economy:  City 15 / Highway 21

2014 Ram 1500 Sport 4x4 Prepare your eyes for the wonder and
greatness that is this 2014 Ram 1500 Sport 4x4, a truck that combines
raw power with refined style. All I have to do is say HEMI 5.7L V8
engine and everything becomes clear. The Ram is incredibly powerful,
and it uses that power for the good of the driver, turning difficult jobs
into pieces of cake. The Sport Performance Hood not only enhances the
truck???s aggressive look but also improves aerodynamics. The
Convenience Group and Quick Order Package 26L add thoughtful
touches like the Remote Start and Security Group, allowing you to start
your vehicle from a distance and keep it secure with ease. Step inside,
and you???ll be welcomed by a cabin designed for comfort and
convenience. The Sport Premium Group ensures you ride in style with
a heated steering wheel wrapped in leather, making those cold
mornings much more bearable. The driver seat offers 10 power
adjustments, allowing you to find the perfect driving position, while the
automatic climate control with dual zones keeps you and your
passengers comfortable no matter the weather. Stay connected and
entertained with the auxiliary audio input and Bluetooth wireless data
link, making it easy to stream your favorite music or take hands-free
calls on the go. The power-adjustable pedals ensure that drivers of all
sizes can find their ideal driving posture, enhancing comfort and
control. On the exterior, the polished aluminum alloy wheels add a
touch of sophistication and durability, while the Class IV Receiver Hitch
is ready to handle your towing needs. This truck is not just about power
and performance; it???s also about practicality and functionality. The
all-terrain tires all but guarantee that you can go where other trucks are
too frightened to. The 2014 Ram 1500 Sport 4x4 is ready to tackle any
challenge you throw at it and look good doing it. Come take it for a test
drive today and experience the thrill for yourself! This vehicle has been
reduced
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Installed Options

Interior

- Front air conditioning: automatic climate control  - Front air conditioning zones: dual  

- Armrests: rear center folding with storage  - Floor mat material: carpet - Floor mats: front 

- Heated steering wheel - Shift knob trim: chrome  - Steering wheel trim: leather 

- Adjustable pedals: power - Ambient lighting - Ashtray - Cruise control 

- Multi-function remote: keyless entry - Power outlet(s): 115V - Power steering 

- Rearview mirror: auto-dimming - Universal remote transmitter: garage door opener  - Clock 

- Compass - Customizable instrument cluster - Digital odometer 

- External temperature display - Instrument cluster screen size: 7 in. - Multi-function display 

- Powertrain hour meter  - Trip odometer - Driver seat: heated  

- Driver seat power adjustments: 10  - Front seat type: bucket  - Passenger seat: heated  

- Passenger seat manual adjustments - Rear seat folding: folds up  

- Rear seat type: 60-40 split bench  - Upholstery: cloth

Exterior

- Exhaust: dual tip - Front bumper color: body-color - Mirror color: body-color 

- Pickup bed light - Daytime running lights: LED - Exterior entry lights: puddle lamps  

- Front fog lights  - Side mirror adjustments: power - Side mirrors: auto-dimming 

- Spare wheel type: steel  - Tire Pressure Monitoring System 

- Wheels: polished aluminum alloy - Front wipers: variable intermittent 

- Pickup sliding rear window: power horizontal  - Power windows - Rear privacy glass
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