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Our Price $19,995
Specifications:

Year:  2017  

VIN:  1G6AK5SS6H0216475  

Make:  Cadillac  

Stock:  P7174  

Model/Trim:  ATS 3.6L Premium Luxury  

Condition:  Pre-Owned  

Body:  Sedan  

Exterior:  Black Raven  

Engine:  3.6L V6 335hp 285ft. lbs.  

Interior:  Jet Black With Jet Black Accents Leather  

Transmission:  8-Speed Shiftable Automatic  

Mileage:  77,594  

Drivetrain:  All Wheel Drive  

Economy:  City 19 / Highway 27

Step into the realm of luxury and performance with the stunning 2017
Cadillac ATS 3.6L Premium Luxury, a vehicle that promises to elevate
your driving experience to unparalleled heights. With only 77,594 miles,
this sophisticated black beauty is ready to offer you many more miles of
exhilarating journeys.

From the moment you lay eyes on its sleek black exterior, you'll
understand why the Cadillac ATS is synonymous with elegance and
style. The meticulously crafted design exudes a sense of power and
grace, ensuring that you turn heads wherever you go. But the allure
doesn't stop at the exterior. Step inside, and you'll be enveloped in an
oasis of opulence, courtesy of the sumptuous black leather interior. The
seats are not only visually striking but also provide the utmost comfort,
making every drive a pleasure, whether it's a quick trip around town or
a long-distance adventure.

Under the hood lies the heart of this magnificent machine—a robust
3.6L V6 engine that delivers an impressive 335 horsepower and 285 ft.
lbs. of torque. This powerhouse ensures that you'll always have the
performance you need at your fingertips, whether you're merging onto
the highway or navigating through city streets. The 8-Speed Shiftable
Automatic transmission offers smooth and responsive gear changes,
giving you the flexibility to enjoy a relaxed drive or a more spirited
performance, depending on your mood.

The 2017 Cadillac ATS 3.6L Premium Luxury isn't just about power and
beauty; it's also packed with advanced features and manufacturer
options designed to enhance your driving experience. This vehicle has
been meticulously engineered to provide the highest levels of comfort,
convenience, and safety, ensuring that you and your passengers can
enjoy every journey to the fullest.
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enjoy every journey to the fullest.

What sets this Cadillac ATS apart is its recognition in the automotive
industry. It has been awarded the highest ranking in J.D. Power and
Associates's Initial Quality Study (IQS), a testament to its exceptional
build quality and reliability. This accolade provides you with the
confidence that you're investing in a vehicle that stands out in terms of
initial quality and long-term dependability.

Imagine yourself behind the wheel of this extraordinary vehicle,
experiencing the perfect blend of luxury, performance, and cutting-edge
technology. The 2017 Cadillac ATS 3.6L Premium Luxury is more than
just a car; it's a statement of your discerning taste and appreciation for
the finer things in life.

Don't miss out on the opportunity to own this exceptional vehicle. With
its striking black-on-black color scheme, powerful V6 engine, and
award-winning quality, the 2017 Cadillac ATS 3.6L Premium Luxury is a
rare gem that won't stay on the market for long. Contact us today to
schedule a test drive and experience firsthand the unparalleled luxury
and performance that only a Cadillac can offer. Your dream car awaits!
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Installed Options

Interior

- Air filtration - Front air conditioning: automatic climate control  

- Front air conditioning zones: dual  - Rear vents: second row 

- Armrests: rear center folding with pass-thru  - Floor mat material: carpet - Floor mats: front 

- Foot pedal trim: aluminum - Shift knob trim: alloy  - Steering wheel trim: leather 

- Capless fuel filler system - Cargo area light - Cruise control - Memorized settings: 2 driver 

- Power outlet(s): 12V front  - Power steering: variable/speed-proportional - Push-button start 

- Rearview mirror: auto-dimming - Remote engine start - Steering wheel: tilt and telescopic  

- Universal remote transmitter: garage door opener  - Wireless charging station: front - Clock

- Compass - Customizable instrument cluster - Digital odometer 

- External temperature display - Instrument cluster screen size: 5.7 in.  

- Multi-function display - Trip odometer - Driver seat power adjustments: 10  

- Front seat type: bucket  - Passenger seat power adjustments: 10  - Rear seat folding: split  

- Rear seat type: bench  - Upholstery: leather

Exterior

- Exhaust: dual tip - Front bumper color: body-color - Mirror color: body-color 

- Daytime running lights: LED - Exterior entry lights: puddle lamps  

- Side mirrors: driver side auto-dimming - Run flat tires - Tire Pressure Monitoring System 

- Wheels: painted aluminum alloy - Laminated glass: acoustic windshield  

- Power windows: safety reverse  - Solar-tinted glass - Tinted glass: windshield 

- Window defogger: rear
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