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Special Price $28,000
Retail Price $29,500

Specifications:

Year:  2023  

VIN:  2C4RC1BG8PR560010  

Make:  Chrysler  

Stock:  16311  

Model/Trim:  Pacifica Touring L  

Condition:  Pre-Owned  

Body:  Minivan/Van  

Exterior:  BLACK  

Engine:  Pentastar 3.6L V6 287hp 262ft. lbs.  

Interior:  Black Leatherette  

Transmission:  9-Speed Shiftable Automatic  

Mileage:  48,404  

Drivetrain:  Front Wheel Drive  

Economy:  City 19 / Highway 28

**Unleash the Ultimate Family Adventure with the 2023 Chrysler
Pacifica Touring L!**

Step into the realm of unmatched sophistication and performance with
the 2023 Chrysler Pacifica Touring L, a minivan that redefines the
driving experience. Dressed to impress in a sleek, captivating black
exterior, this vehicle is the epitome of modern elegance and practicality.
Whether you're navigating city streets or embarking on a cross-country
journey, the Pacifica Touring L ensures you do so in unparalleled style
and comfort.

**Exterior Elegance and Commanding Presence**

The black exterior of the 2023 Chrysler Pacifica Touring L is more than
just a color; it's a statement. This bold hue accentuates the vehicle's
aerodynamic contours and refined lines, making it a head-turner
wherever you go. The Pacifica's design is not only about looks but also
about functionality. The sculpted body enhances fuel efficiency while
providing a smooth, quiet ride. With its distinctive front grille, sleek LED
headlights, and stylish alloy wheels, this minivan exudes confidence
and sophistication.

**Luxurious and Comfortable Interior**

Slide into the opulent interior, and you'll be greeted by sumptuous black
leatherette seating that promises a first-class experience for every
passenger. The meticulously crafted cabin is designed with both driver
and passengers in mind, offering ample space, advanced ergonomics,
and top-notch materials. The black leatherette seats are not only
visually striking but also incredibly comfortable and easy to maintain,
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visually striking but also incredibly comfortable and easy to maintain,
ensuring your Pacifica looks pristine for years to come.

**Power and Performance**

Under the hood, the 2023 Chrysler Pacifica Touring L boasts the robust
Pentastar 3.6L V6 engine, delivering an impressive 287 horsepower
and 262 lb-ft of torque. This powerhouse ensures you have all the
muscle you need for smooth, confident acceleration, whether you're
merging onto the highway or cruising through town. Paired with a 9-
speed shiftable automatic transmission, the Pacifica offers seamless
gear changes and optimal fuel efficiency, making every drive an
exhilarating yet economical experience.

**Advanced Technology and Safety Features**

The Pacifica Touring L is packed with cutting-edge technology designed
to keep you connected, entertained, and safe. The intuitive infotainment
system provides easy access to navigation, music, and hands-free
communication, ensuring you stay focused on the road ahead. Safety is
paramount, and the Pacifica is equipped with a suite of advanced safety
features, including adaptive cruise control, blind-spot monitoring, and
lane-keeping assist. These features work together to provide peace of
mind, knowing that you and your loved ones are protected on every
journey.

**Versatility and Convenience**

The 2023 Chrysler Pacifica Touring L is engineered to accommodate
your dynamic lifestyle. With its versatile seating configurations and
ample cargo space, this minivan adapts effortlessly to your needs. The
Stow 'n Go seating system allows you to fold the second and third-row
seats into the floor, creating a flat load space for larger items. Whether
you're transporting sports equipment, groceries, or luggage for a family
vacation, the Pacifica has you covered.

**Conclusion**

The 2023 Chrysler Pacifica Touring L is not just a vehicle; it's a lifestyle
upgrade. Combining striking aesthetics, luxurious comfort, powerful
performance, and state-of-the-art technology, this minivan is designed
to exceed your expectations. Don't miss the opportunity to elevate your
driving experience with the Pacifica Touring L. Visit your nearest
Chrysler dealership today and take this exceptional vehicle for a test
drive. Feel the difference, embrace the luxury, and embark on your next
adventure with confidence and excitement!
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Vehicle History Report : as Of 07/02/2024

*carfax Snapshot is a reflection of available information on the date the report was pulled. carfax
is constantly being updated with new information and is subject to change at any time.

 

Our Location :
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Snapshot

2023 CHRYSLER PACIFICA TOURING L

No accidents or damage reported to
CARFAX

4 Service history
records

At least 1 open
recall

CARFAX 1-Owner
vehicle

Rental
vehicle

48,404 Last reported odometer
reading

FREE CARFAX Report

See the full CARFAX Report for additional information

https://www.carfax.com/VehicleHistory/p/Report.cfx?partner=AVR_0&vin=2C4RC1BG8PR560010&source=BUP
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Installed Options

Interior

- Air filtration - Front air conditioning: automatic climate control  

- Front air conditioning zones: dual  - Rear air conditioning: automatic climate control  

- Rear vents: third row - Door trim: vinyl - Floor mat material: carpet - Floor mats: front 

- Heated steering wheel - Interior accents: chrome  - Steering wheel trim: leatherette 

- Adaptive cruise control  - Adaptive stop and go cruise control: semi-automatic  

- Ambient lighting - Capless fuel filler system - Cargo area light - Conversation mirror 

- Memorized settings: 2 driver - Power outlet(s): 12V cargo area  

- Power steering: variable/speed-proportional - Push-button start - Remote engine start 

- Steering wheel: tilt and telescopic  - Sunshade: side window - Clock - Compass 

- Customizable instrument cluster - Digital odometer - External temperature display 

- Instrument cluster screen size: 7 in. - Multi-function display - Trip odometer 

- Driver seat: heated  - Front seat type: bucket  - Passenger seat: heated  

- Rear seat folding: fold flat into floor  - Rear seat type: captains chairs  

- Third row seat folding: fold flat into floor  - Third row seat type: 40-60 split bench  

- Upholstery: leatherette - Upholstery accents: contrast stitching

Exterior

- Active grille shutters - Front bumper color: body-color - Mirror color: body-color 

- Rear spoiler: roofline - Side door type: dual power sliding  - Daytime running lights: LED 

- Front fog lights: LED - Taillights: LED - Side mirrors: heated  - Spare tire kit: inflator kit  

- Tire Pressure Monitoring System - Wheels: painted aluminum alloy 

- Front wipers: rain sensing  - Laminated glass: acoustic windshield  

- Power windows: safety reverse  - Rear privacy glass - Rear wiper: intermittent 

- Solar-tinted glass - Window defogger: rear
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