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No-Haggle Price $12,495
Specifications:

Year:  2020  

VIN:  5NPD74LF8LH611955  

Make:  Hyundai  

Stock:  6450  

Model/Trim:  ELANTRA SE  

Condition:  Pre-Owned  

Body:  Sedan  

Exterior:  [2C] Machine Gray  

Engine:  Nu 2.0L I4 147hp 132ft. lbs.  

Interior:  Gray Cloth  

Transmission:  CVT  

Mileage:  90,922  

Drivetrain:  Front Wheel Drive  

Economy:  City 31 / Highway 41

Discover the perfect blend of style, performance, and advanced
technology with the 2020 Hyundai ELANTRA SE! This exceptional
compact sedan, with its sophisticated gray exterior and inviting gray
cloth interior, is designed to make every drive an experience to
remember. Whether you're commuting to work, running errands, or
embarking on a weekend getaway, the ELANTRA SE is your ideal
companion.

At the heart of the 2020 Hyundai ELANTRA SE lies the robust Nu 2.0L
I4 engine, delivering an impressive 147 horsepower and 132 lb-ft of
torque. Paired with a smooth and efficient Continuously Variable
Transmission (CVT), this powertrain ensures a dynamic yet fuel-efficient
ride, giving you the best of both worlds. Imagine effortlessly cruising
down the highway with the confidence that comes from knowing your
vehicle is both powerful and economical.

Safety is paramount in the ELANTRA SE, and Hyundai has equipped
this model with an array of advanced safety features to keep you and
your passengers protected. The Automatic Emergency Braking system
with front collision warning, Lane Keeping Assist, and the Driver
Attention Alert System work together to help prevent accidents before
they happen. The Pre-Collision Warning System with audible alerts and
Lane Deviation Sensors add an extra layer of security, ensuring you
stay on course and aware of your surroundings at all times.

Inside, the ELANTRA SE offers a haven of comfort and convenience.
The premium gray cloth upholstery provides a touch of luxury, while the
spacious cabin ensures that everyone travels in comfort. The intuitive
layout puts everything you need within easy reach, including the
auxiliary audio input and Bluetooth wireless data link, allowing you to
stay connected and entertained on the go. With hands-free phone call
integration, you can keep your hands on the wheel and your eyes on
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integration, you can keep your hands on the wheel and your eyes on
the road, making every journey safer and more enjoyable.

The ELANTRA SE is also equipped with a comprehensive suite of
airbags, including knee airbags for the driver, front side airbags, and
front side curtain airbags, providing peace of mind for everyone on
board. The rearview camera system makes parking and reversing a
breeze, giving you a clear view of what's behind you.

One of the standout features of the 2020 Hyundai ELANTRA SE is its
award-winning dependability. Recognized by J.D. Power and
Associates's Vehicle Dependability Study (VDS) as one of the top
models, you can trust that the ELANTRA SE is built to last. Additionally,
it has been honored with Kelley Blue Book's 5-Year Cost to Own Award
for the Best Compact Car, making it a smart investment for the long
term.

Driving the 2020 Hyundai ELANTRA SE is not just about getting from
point A to point B; it's about enjoying the journey with confidence and
excitement. The variable/speed-proportional power steering and cruise
control make long drives more comfortable and effortless, while the
sleek gray exterior ensures you arrive in style.

Ready to experience the 2020 Hyundai ELANTRA SE for yourself?
Click on the Warranty Tab for more details and take the first step
towards owning this incredible vehicle today. Don't miss out on the
opportunity to drive a car that combines performance, safety, and value
in one stunning package. Visit us now and take the ELANTRA SE for a
test drive – your future on the road awaits!
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Vehicle History Report : as Of 06/30/2024

*carfax Snapshot is a reflection of available information on the date the report was pulled. carfax
is constantly being updated with new information and is subject to change at any time.

 

Our Location :

2020 Hyundai ELANTRA SE 

Snapshot

2020 HYUNDAI ELANTRA SE

Accident reported

4 Service history
records

9 Detailed records available

90,922 Last reported odometer
reading

FREE CARFAX Report

See the full CARFAX Report for additional information
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Installed Options

Interior

- Air filtration - Front air conditioning  - Rear vents: second row - Cargo area light 

- Cruise control - Multi-function remote: keyless entry - Power outlet(s): two 12V front  

- Power steering: variable/speed-proportional - Steering wheel: tilt and telescopic  - Clock 

- Digital odometer - External temperature display - Multi-function display - Trip odometer 

- Front seat type: bucket  - Rear seat folding: split  - Rear seat type: 60-40 split bench  

- Upholstery: premium cloth

Exterior

- Front bumper color: body-color - Mirror color: body-color - Daytime running lights  

- Spare wheel type: steel  - Tire Pressure Monitoring System - Wheels: steel 

- Front wipers: variable intermittent - Power windows: safety reverse  - Solar-tinted glass 

- Window defogger: rear

Prices do not include sales tax, registration fees and dealer conveyance fee of 799. If you have a trade-in your sales tax will be reduced based on the difference between the car

you are purchasing and your trade-in. Final credit decisions are made by lenders. The advertised price is the price for this vehicle in its current condition. Any alterations, upgrades,

installations, cosmetic work, or any other additions requested by the customer would incur an additional cost, to be added to the selling price of the vehicle. The price does not

include sales tax, vehicle registration charges, cost of additional requests by the customer, finance charges, processing charges, or any other charges required by law. The dealer

reserves the right to pass all vehicles through Connecticut State inspection prior to delivery. The dealer attempts to update this inventory on a regular basis, however, there can be a

delay between the sale of a vehicle and the update of the dealer’s online inventory. Advertised price does not include sales tax, vehicle registration charges, cost of additional

requests by the customer, finance charges, processing charges, or any other charges required by law. Vehicles are sold cosmetically as is and equipped as is. Costs incurred by

Sound Auto Wholesalers as a result of customer requests are not included in advertised prices. Customer must present a signed copy of this ad at the time of purchase. Online

pricing excludes all prior offers, and may not be combined with any other offers, coupons, or discounts. Vehicle options and pricing are subject to change. Special price includes all

dealer rebates and incentives. Finance promotions based on tier 1 credit approval after 20% down payment. All online prices expire at 12:01 PM today. Sound Auto Wholesalers will

honor expired advertised prices up to 24 hours after expiration, provided the customer presents a signed, printed copy of the advertised price at the start of their visit. We make

every effort to adequately represent the condition and features of all our inventory including vehicle information, pictures, pricing, and status but there may be inaccuracies. Sound

Auto Wholesalers assumes no responsibility for inaccuracies in online information nor is it responsible for errors in any third-party advertisements. Please confirm any questions or

concerns by contacting Sound Auto Wholesalers directly. EPA mileage estimates are based on model year EPA mileage ratings and are for comparison purposes only. Your actual

mileage will vary depending on how you drive and maintain your vehicle. Before purchasing this vehicle, it is solely the customer’s responsibility to address any and all differences

between the information on this website and the actual vehicle specifications and/or warranties offered prior to the sale of this vehicle. Vehicle data on this website is compiled from

publicly available sources believed by the publisher to be reliable. Vehicle data is subject to change without notice. The publisher assumes no responsibility for errors and/or

omissions in this data and its compilation, and makes no representations expressed or implied to any actual or prospective purchaser of the vehicle as to the condition of the vehicle,

vehicle specifications, ownership, vehicle history, equipment/accessories, price, or warranties.
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