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2019 Dodge Grand Caravan SE
View this car on our website at bleskinmotors.com/7318180/ebrochure

 

Our Price $16,995
Specifications:

Year:  2019  

VIN:  2C4RDGBG4KR793150  

Make:  Dodge  

Stock:  24210  

Model/Trim:  Grand Caravan SE  

Condition:  Pre-Owned  

Body:  Minivan/Van  

Exterior:  Blue  

Engine:  Pentastar 3.6L Flex Fuel V6 283hp 260ft.
lbs.

 

Interior:  -  

Transmission:  6-Speed Shiftable Automatic  

Mileage:  74,620  

Drivetrain:  Front Wheel Drive  

Economy:  City 14 / Highway 22

Step into the realm of sophistication and reliability with our stunning
2019 Dodge Grand Caravan SE, a beacon of versatility in a
mesmerizing blue exterior that is sure to turn heads. With a mere
74,620 miles on the odometer, this family-friendly warrior stands ready
to deliver countless adventures for you and your loved ones.

At the heart of this majestic machine lies the revered Pentastar 3.6L
Flex Fuel V6 engine, a powerhouse that churns out an impressive 283
horsepower and 260 ft-lbs of torque. This engine is not just about raw
strength; it's a symphony of engineering excellence that ensures
smooth sailing on highways and byways alike. Coupled with a 6-speed
shiftable automatic transmission, the Grand Caravan SE offers a driving
experience that is both exhilarating and serene, giving you the control
you crave with the ease you deserve.

As you slide behind the wheel, you'll be enveloped in a cabin that
echoes Dodge's commitment to comfort and convenience. The
manufacturer options and packages have been meticulously selected to
enhance every aspect of your journey. From the supportive seats that
cradle you on long drives to the intuitive layout of controls, every detail
has been fine-tuned for your pleasure.

But the Grand Caravan SE isn't just about the driving experience—it's
also a testament to dependability. This vehicle proudly boasts awards
from J.D. Power and Associates's Vehicle Dependability Study (VDS),
where it was ranked the Highest. Such an accolade is a clear indicator
of the trust and satisfaction that owners have placed in this model,
ensuring you that this vehicle is a choice you can count on for the long
haul.
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Moreover, the Dodge brand carries the honor of Kelley Blue Book's
Brand Image Awards for Best Styling Brand, a testament to the Grand
Caravan SE's ability to stand out from the crowd with its distinctive
design and aesthetic appeal. This is a vehicle that doesn't just meet
expectations—it sets them.

Imagine the possibilities as you embark on family trips, weekend
getaways, or simply the daily commute. The ample space and flexibility
of the Grand Caravan SE mean that whether you're transporting cargo
or cherishing moments with your family, you'll have the adaptability to
meet life's demands with grace and style.

As a discerning buyer, you understand the importance of making an
informed decision. The 2019 Dodge Grand Caravan SE presents a
compelling proposition—a vehicle that harmoniously blends power,
style, and reliability. It's a choice that reflects not just your need for a
practical mode of transportation but also your desire for a vehicle that
adds joy and prestige to every drive.

Don't let this opportunity pass you by. Embrace the chance to own a
vehicle that has been crafted to exceed expectations and provide
unparalleled satisfaction. Visit us today to experience the allure of the
2019 Dodge Grand Caravan SE in person, and take the first step
towards claiming this blue jewel as your own.
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Vehicle History Report : as Of 07/27/2024

*carfax Snapshot is a reflection of available information on the date the report was pulled. carfax
is constantly being updated with new information and is subject to change at any time.

 

Our Location :
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Snapshot

2019 DODGE GRAND CARAVAN SE

Accident reported: minor damage

MINOR MODERATE SEVERE

7 Detailed records available

74,620 Last reported odometer
reading

FREE CARFAX Report

See the full CARFAX Report for additional information

https://bleskinmotors.com/vehicle/7318180/2019-dodge-grand-caravan-se-great-falls-montana-59405/7318180/ebrochure
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Installed Options

Interior

- Air filtration - Front air conditioning  - Front air conditioning zones: dual  

- Rear air conditioning: independently controlled  - Floor mat material: rubber/vinyl 

- Floor mats: front - Cargo area light - Conversation mirror - Cruise control 

- Multi-function remote: keyless entry - Power outlet(s): 12V front  - Power steering 

- Rearview mirror: auto-dimming - Steering wheel: tilt and telescopic  - Clock 

- Digital odometer - External temperature display - Multi-function display - Trip odometer 

- Front seat type: bucket  - Rear seat type: 60-40 split bench  

- Third row seat folding: fold flat into floor  - Third row seat type: 40-60 split bench  

- Upholstery: cloth

Exterior

- Front bumper color: body-color - Grille color: black with chrome accents  

- Daytime running lights  - Side mirrors: heated  - Spare tire kit: inflator kit  

- Tire Pressure Monitoring System - Wheels: steel - Front wipers: variable intermittent 

- Power windows: safety reverse  - Rear quarter windows: power - Rear wiper: intermittent 

- Solar-tinted glass - Window defogger: rear
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