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Sales Price $16,990
List Price $18,625

Specifications:

Year:  2019  

VIN:  3GNAXKEV4KS583174  

Make:  Chevrolet  

Stock:  583174  

Model/Trim:  Equinox LT  

Condition:  New  

Body:  SUV  

Exterior:  Pepperdust Metallic  

Engine:  1.5L Turbo I4 170hp 203ft. lbs.  

Interior:  Medium Ash Gray  

Transmission:  6-Speed Shiftable Automatic  

Mileage:  59,126  

Drivetrain:  Front Wheel Drive  

Economy:  City 26 / Highway 32

Step into the world of refined comfort and commanding performance
with the 2019 Chevrolet Equinox LT, a compact SUV that's been
crowned with the highest honors in initial quality by J.D. Power and
Associates. With a mere 59,126 miles on the odometer, this Equinox is
primed and ready to deliver the seamless blend of efficiency and power
that you've been searching for.

Under the hood lies a robust 1.5L Turbocharged I4 engine, boasting
170 horsepower and 203 ft-lbs of torque, ensuring a responsive and
spirited drive every time you hit the road. Paired with a 6-speed
shiftable automatic transmission, this vehicle offers a smooth and
intuitive driving experience, allowing for both the ease of automatic
shifting and the control of manual gear selection.

The sleek exterior of the Equinox LT is matched by an equally
impressive gray interior, the specifics of which remain a canvas for your
personal discovery. Step inside and you'll find a cabin designed with the
utmost attention to comfort and style, creating an ambiance that is both
inviting and sophisticated.

As you slide into the driver's seat, you'll immediately feel the confidence
that comes with piloting a vehicle recognized for its exceptional initial
quality. The Equinox LT is a testament to Chevrolet's commitment to
excellence, and it's evident in every detail, from the meticulously crafted
interior to the smooth contours of the exterior design.

The Equinox LT doesn't just excel in aesthetics and performance; it's
also equipped with a suite of manufacturer options and packages that
enhance every aspect of your driving experience. While the specifics of
these options are yours to explore and enjoy, rest assured that they
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these options are yours to explore and enjoy, rest assured that they
contribute to the vehicle's reputation for providing a superior level of
convenience, safety, and entertainment.

Safety is paramount in the Equinox LT, and with its high-quality build
and advanced safety features, you can drive with peace of mind
knowing that you and your passengers are well-protected. The compact
SUV segment is competitive, but the Equinox stands out with its blend
of practicality and premium features.

Imagine the possibilities that await you with the 2019 Chevrolet Equinox
LT. Whether it's the daily commute, a weekend getaway, or simply
running errands around town, this vehicle is equipped to handle it all
with grace and agility. The Equinox LT is not just a mode of
transportation; it's a statement of your discerning taste and an
investment in your driving pleasure.

Don't miss the opportunity to own this exceptional vehicle. With its
proven track record, impressive performance, and luxurious comfort,
the 2019 Chevrolet Equinox LT is ready to elevate your driving
experience to new heights. Visit us today for a test drive, and prepare to
be captivated by the perfect combination of sophistication and reliability
that only the Equinox can offer. Your journey awaits.

... Read the full description on our Website at: www.vistacars.com
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Installed Options

Interior

- Air filtration - Front air conditioning  - Rear vents: second row - Floor mat material: carpet 

- Floor mats: front - Cargo area light - Cruise control - Power outlet(s): 12V cargo area  

- Power steering - Push-button start - Steering wheel: tilt and telescopic  - Tool kit - Clock 

- Digital odometer - External temperature display - Multi-function display - Trip odometer 

- Driver seat power adjustments: 8  - Front seat type: bucket  - Rear seat folding: split  

- Rear seat type: 60-40 split bench  - Upholstery: premium cloth

Exterior

- Active grille shutters - Grille color: black with chrome accents  - Mirror color: body-color 

- Daytime running lights: LED - Side mirrors: heated  - Spare wheel type: steel  

- Tire Pressure Monitoring System - Wheels: aluminum alloy 

- Front wipers: variable intermittent - Laminated glass: acoustic windshield  

- Power windows: safety reverse  - Rear privacy glass - Rear wiper: variable intermittent 

- Solar-tinted glass: front - Window defogger: rear

All prices listed are CASH Discounted Prices plus tax, title, license and fees.
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