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Internet Price $17,800
Retail Value $18,800

Specifications:

Year:  2021  

VIN:  3N1CN8EV4ML820143  

Make:  Nissan  

Stock:  820143  

Model/Trim:  Versa SV  

Condition:  Pre-Owned  

Body:  Sedan  

Exterior:  [B51] Electric Blue Metallic  

Engine:  1.6L I4 122hp 114ft. lbs.  

Interior:  BLACK  

Transmission:  CVT  

Mileage:  57,927  

Drivetrain:  Front Wheel Drive  

Economy:  City 32 / Highway 40

Autocheck One Owner!!

Ledet's Auto Sales proudly services every vehicle before the sale to
ensure customer satisfaction. All vehicles pass a specific multi-point
inspection before it goes to our lot. We also offer a number of different
warranties for our vehicles. Come by or call today to see what specials
we are offering!

Step into the future of driving with the stunning 2021 Nissan Versa SV!
This dynamic compact sedan is designed to elevate your daily
commute and weekend adventures with style, efficiency, and cutting-
edge technology. With its eye-catching blue exterior, the Versa SV is
sure to turn heads wherever you go, exuding a sense of modern
sophistication and vibrant energy.

Under the hood, the 2021 Nissan Versa SV is powered by a spirited
1.6L I4 engine that delivers an impressive 122 horsepower and 114 ft-
lbs of torque. This robust powertrain, paired with a smooth and efficient
Continuously Variable Transmission (CVT), ensures a responsive and
exhilarating driving experience. Whether you're navigating city streets or
cruising on the highway, the Versa SV offers seamless acceleration and
exceptional fuel efficiency, making every journey a joy.

Step inside the cabin, and you'll be greeted by a sleek and stylish black
interior that perfectly complements the striking blue exterior. The
thoughtfully designed interior offers a comfortable and inviting
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thoughtfully designed interior offers a comfortable and inviting
atmosphere, with high-quality materials and intuitive controls that put
everything you need at your fingertips. The spacious seating provides
ample room for both driver and passengers, ensuring a comfortable ride
for everyone.

The 2021 Nissan Versa SV is packed with advanced features and
manufacturer options that enhance your driving experience and provide
peace of mind. Stay connected and entertained with the user-friendly
infotainment system, which includes a vibrant touchscreen display,
Bluetooth connectivity, and smartphone integration. Enjoy your favorite
music, make hands-free calls, and access navigation with ease, all
while keeping your focus on the road ahead.

Safety is a top priority in the Versa SV, and it comes equipped with a
suite of advanced safety features designed to protect you and your
loved ones. The comprehensive safety package includes automatic
emergency braking, lane departure warning, and blind-spot monitoring,
providing an extra layer of confidence and security on every drive. With
these intelligent safety systems, you can drive with peace of mind,
knowing that your vehicle is looking out for you.

The 2021 Nissan Versa SV also offers impressive practicality and
convenience, with a spacious trunk that provides ample storage for all
your gear and groceries. The rear seats can be easily folded down to
accommodate larger items, making it a versatile companion for all your
adventures.

In summary, the 2021 Nissan Versa SV is a standout choice for those
seeking a stylish, efficient, and feature-packed compact sedan. Its
powerful engine, smooth CVT transmission, and advanced safety
features make it a reliable and enjoyable vehicle for any journey. The
striking blue exterior and sleek black interior create a modern and
sophisticated look that sets it apart from the competition.

Don't miss your chance to own this exceptional vehicle! Visit our
dealership today and take the 2021 Nissan Versa SV for a test drive.
Experience the perfect blend of performance, comfort, and technology,
and discover why the Versa SV is the ideal choice for your next car. Act
fast, because this incredible offer won't last long!
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Vehicle History Report : as Of 07/27/2024

*carfax Snapshot is a reflection of available information on the date the report was pulled. carfax
is constantly being updated with new information and is subject to change at any time.

 

Our Location :
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Installed Options

Interior

- Air filtration - Front air conditioning  - Dash trim: leatherette 

- Door trim: simulated carbon fiber - Cargo area light - Cruise control 

- Multi-function remote: keyless entry - Power outlet(s): 12V front  

- Power steering: variable/speed-proportional - Push-button start 

- Steering wheel: tilt and telescopic  - Clock - Digital odometer - External temperature display

- Multi-function display - Trip odometer - Front seat type: bucket  - Rear seat folding: split  

- Rear seat type: 60-40 split bench  - Upholstery: premium cloth

Exterior

- Front bumper color: body-color - Mirror color: body-color - Side mirrors: heated  

- Spare wheel type: steel  - Tire Pressure Monitoring System - Wheels: aluminum alloy 

- Front wipers: variable intermittent - Laminated glass: acoustic windshield  

- Power windows: safety reverse  - Window defogger: rear

Snapshot

2021 NISSAN VERSA SV

No accidents or damage reported to
CARFAX

3 Service history
records

CARFAX 1-Owner
vehicle

Rental
vehicle

Last owned in
Wisconsin

57,894 Last reported odometer
reading

FREE CARFAX Report

See the full CARFAX Report for additional information

https://www.carfax.com/VehicleHistory/p/Report.cfx?partner=AVR_0&vin=3N1CN8EV4ML820143&source=BUP
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