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Our Price $19,995
Retail Value $21,995

Specifications:

Year:  2018  

VIN:  3C4NJDCB7JT147721  

Make:  Jeep  

Stock:  A000178  

Model/Trim:  Compass 4WD Limited  

Condition:  Pre-Owned  

Body:  SUV  

Exterior:  Billet Silver Metallic Clearcoat  

Engine:  Tigershark 2.4L I4 180hp 175ft. lbs.  

Interior:  Black Leather  

Transmission:  9-Speed Shiftable Automatic  

Mileage:  70,421  

Drivetrain:  4 Wheel Drive  

Economy:  City 22 / Highway 30

**Discover the Pinnacle of Adventure with the 2018 Jeep Compass
Limited**

Embark on your next journey with the epitome of style and performance
– the 2018 Jeep Compass Limited. With only 70,421 miles on the
odometer, this silver stunner boasts a sleek exterior that captures the
essence of freedom and the spirit of adventure. The Compass Limited is
not just a vehicle; it's a statement on wheels, ready to take you
wherever your heart desires with confidence and grace.

**Exquisite Design Meets Exceptional Comfort**

As you approach this magnificent machine, the exterior entry lights
warmly invite you in, while the body-color mirror and front bumper,
accentuated by a black grille with chrome accents, exude a sense of
sophistication. The dual-tip exhaust hints at the power that lies within,
and the cornering front fog lights ensure that even the mistiest mornings
won't dampen your drive.

Slip into the driver's seat and find yourself enveloped in a world of
luxurious black interior, where comfort meets functionality. The
Compass Limited is designed to be your sanctuary on the road, a place
where you can relax and enjoy the journey ahead.

**Performance That Commands the Road**

Under the hood, the Tigershark 2.4L I4 engine roars to life with 180
horsepower and 175 ft. lbs. of torque, ready to conquer any terrain. The
9-Speed Shiftable Automatic transmission offers seamless shifts and
unparalleled control, allowing you to focus on the pure joy of driving.
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unparalleled control, allowing you to focus on the pure joy of driving.

With the Compass Limited, you don't just drive; you command the road.
Every twist and turn is an opportunity to experience the thrill of precision
engineering and the confidence that comes with Jeep's legendary
capability.

**Technology at Your Fingertips**

Stay connected and in control with the Uconnect infotainment system,
boasting an 8.4-inch screen that becomes the nerve center of your
Compass Limited. Whether you're streaming your favorite tunes
through the six-speaker audio system, navigating with SiriusXM satellite
radio, or using voice-operated electronic messaging assistance, you're
always just a touch away from convenience and entertainment.

The Compass Limited understands the modern driver's need for
seamless smartphone integration. With Android Auto at your disposal,
your vehicle becomes an extension of your digital life, keeping you
connected and informed no matter where the road takes you.

**Safety and Security That Inspire Confidence**

Drive with peace of mind, knowing that the Compass Limited is
equipped with cutting-edge safety features. The daytime running lights
enhance visibility, making sure you're seen and safe at all hours. The
wireless data link Bluetooth technology keeps your focus on the road
while staying connected to your world.

**Your Next Chapter Awaits**

The 2018 Jeep Compass Limited is more than just a vehicle; it's a
partner in your life's adventures. It's a promise of new memories, a
beacon of freedom, and a testament to your discerning taste. Don't let
this opportunity pass you by. Embrace the call of the open road and
make the 2018 Jeep Compass Limited yours today. Adventure, luxury,
and unparalleled performance await.
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Vehicle History Report : as Of 07/27/2024

*carfax Snapshot is a reflection of available information on the date the report was pulled. carfax
is constantly being updated with new information and is subject to change at any time.

 

Our Location :
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Snapshot

2018 JEEP COMPASS LIMITED

No accidents or damage reported to
CARFAX

15 Service history
records

2 Previous owners

Types of owners: Personal lease,
Personal

Last owned in Hawaii

70,421 Last reported odometer
reading

FREE CARFAX Report

See the full CARFAX Report for additional information

https://www.carfax.com/VehicleHistory/p/Report.cfx?partner=AVR_0&vin=3C4NJDCB7JT147721&source=BUP
https://autosourcehawaii.com/vehicle/7313078/2018-jeep-compass-4wd-limited-honolulu-hi-96814/7313078/ebrochure


Installed Options

Interior

- Air filtration - Front air conditioning: automatic climate control  - Humidity/dewpoint sensors 

- Rear vents: second row - Cargo area floor mat - Floor mat material: carpet 

- Floor mats: front - Heated steering wheel - Shift knob trim: leather  

- Steering wheel trim: leather - Ambient lighting - Capless fuel filler system - Cargo area light 

- Cruise control - Power outlet(s): 115V - Power steering: variable/speed-proportional 

- Push-button start - Rearview mirror: auto-dimming - Remote engine start 

- Steering wheel: tilt and telescopic  - Clock - Compass - Customizable instrument cluster 

- Digital odometer - External temperature display - Instrument cluster screen size: 7 in. 

- Multi-function display - Trip odometer - Driver seat: heated  - Front seat type: bucket  

- Passenger seat: heated  - Passenger seat folding: folds flat  - Rear seat folding: split  

- Rear seat type: 60-40 split bench  - Upholstery: leather-trimmed 

- Upholstery accents: contrast stitching

Exterior

- Exhaust: dual tip - Front bumper color: body-color - Grille color: black with chrome accents

- Mirror color: body-color - Daytime running lights  - Exterior entry lights: approach lamps  

- Front fog lights: cornering  - Side mirrors: heated  - Roof rails: chrome 

- Spare tire kit: tire sealant - Tire Pressure Monitoring System 

- Wheels: polished aluminum alloy with painted accents  - Front wipers: variable intermittent 

- Heated windshield wiper rests - Laminated glass: acoustic windshield  - Power windows 

- Rear wiper: with washer  - Tinted glass - Window defogger: rear
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