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66 Auto Sales Price $15,966
Specifications:

Year:  2016  

VIN:  2HKRM3H79GH565262  

Make:  Honda  

Stock:  20761  

Model/Trim:  CR-V EX-L  

Condition:  Pre-Owned  

Body:  SUV  

Exterior:  Gray  

Engine:  2.4L I4 185hp 181ft. lbs.  

Interior:  Black  

Transmission:  CVT  

Mileage:  120,162  

Drivetrain:  Front Wheel Drive  

Economy:  City 26 / Highway 33

*****INTERNET SHOPPERS:  ASK FOR

OUR INTERNET SALESMAN KEVIN
GRANT JR TO ASSIST YOU WHEN YOU CALL OR ARRIVE
AT THE DEALERSHIP AND BECOME ELIGIBLE FOR ADDITIONAL
INCENTIVES AT THE TIME OF PURCHASE!! 

BROWSE MORE INFORMATION ABOUT OUR INVENTORY AT THE
66 AUTO SALES HOME WEBSITE:

WWW.66AUTOSALES.COM!!    [smiley]

 

Step into the realm of refined elegance and commanding performance
with the 2016 Honda CR-V EX-L, a vehicle that effortlessly blends
sophistication with rugged capability. Coated in a sleek gray exterior,
this CR-V is a testament to timeless style and a promise of adventures
to come.

As you slide into the driver's seat, enveloped by the luxurious black
interior, the unknown yet exquisitely comfortable material welcomes you
to a cabin designed for comfort and convenience. The EX-L trim
ensures you're surrounded by top-tier features, making every journey
as enjoyable as the destination.

At the heart of this automotive marvel lies a robust 2.4L I4 engine,
delivering a vigorous 185 horsepower and 181 ft-lbs of torque. Mated to
a seamless CVT transmission, the CR-V EX-L offers a driving
experience that is both dynamic and smooth, ensuring you're always in
the optimal gear for power and efficiency.
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the optimal gear for power and efficiency.

But it's not just the performance that sets this CR-V apart; it's the
recognition. This model has swept the board with accolades, earning
the prestigious Edmunds's Best Retained Value Award for SUVs,
signifying its unwavering quality and enduring appeal. It's also been
crowned as one of Edmunds's Top Recommended SUVs, a nod to its
reliability and consumer satisfaction.

The praise doesn't end there. Kelley Blue Book has honored the 2016
Honda CR-V EX-L with multiple awards, including Best Buy: Small SUV,
for its unbeatable combination of quality, comfort, and value. It's been
recognized as the Best Value Brand, an assurance that your investment
is wise and future-proof. As a Best Family Car, it offers peace of mind
for those precious cargo moments, and as one of the 10 Most Awarded
Cars of the Year, it stands as a testament to Honda's commitment to
excellence.

This CR-V isn't just a vehicle; it's a sanctuary on wheels. It's a partner in
your daily commute, a guardian on family road trips, and a trophy of
your discerning taste. The manufacturer's options and packages have
been meticulously selected to enhance your driving experience,
ensuring that every mile is a pleasure.

Imagine the envy of your neighbors as you glide by in this gray gem,
the embodiment of class and capability. Picture the seamless
integration of power and efficiency as you navigate city streets and
backcountry roads alike. Feel the pride of ownership, knowing that your
CR-V is not just a mode of transportation, but a symbol of your success
and a reliable companion for years to come.

Don't miss the opportunity to claim this distinguished 2016 Honda CR-V
EX-L as your own. Its combination of style, performance, and award-
winning pedigree makes it a rare find and a smart choice for any
discerning buyer. Contact us today to schedule a test drive and
experience firsthand the allure of this exceptional SUV. Your new
adventure awaits.
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Installed Options

Interior

- Air filtration - Front air conditioning: automatic climate control  

- Front air conditioning zones: dual  - Rear vents: second row 

- Armrests: rear center folding with storage  - Floor mat material: carpet - Floor mats: front 

- Steering wheel trim: leather - Cargo area light - Cargo cover: retractable 

- Conversation mirror - Cruise control - Multi-function remote: proximity entry system 

- Power outlet(s): two 12V front  - Power steering - Push-button start 

- Rearview mirror: auto-dimming - Steering wheel: tilt and telescopic  - Clock - Compass 

- Digital odometer - External temperature display - Multi-function display 

- Powertrain hour meter  - Trip odometer - Driver seat: heated  

- Driver seat power adjustments: 10  - Front seat type: bucket  - Passenger seat: heated  

- Passenger seat manual adjustments - Rear seat folding: split  

- Rear seat type: 60-40 split bench  - Upholstery: leather-trimmed

Exterior

- Front bumper color: body-color - Grille color: black with chrome accents  

- Mirror color: body-color - Daytime running lights: LED - Front fog lights  

- Side mirrors: heated  - Roof rails: black  - Spare wheel type: steel  

- Tire Pressure Monitoring System - Wheels: aluminum alloy 

- Front wipers: variable intermittent - Power windows - Rear privacy glass 

- Rear wiper: auto-on in reverse  - Window defogger: rear

*Not all buyers will qualify for posted rate. Please consult with our Internet Department to qualify your rate.
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