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Our Price $20,995
Specifications:

Year:  2021  

VIN:  NM0GE9E28M1489095  

Make:  Ford  

Stock:  24159  

Model/Trim:  Transit Connect XL  

Condition:  Pre-Owned  

Body:  Minivan/Van  

Exterior:  Blue  

Engine:  2.0L I4 162hp 144ft. lbs.  

Interior:  - Vinyl  

Transmission:  8-Speed Shiftable Automatic  

Mileage:  104,469  

Drivetrain:  Front Wheel Drive  

Economy:  City 24 / Highway 29

Introducing the 2021 Ford Transit Connect XL, a versatile and
dependable workhorse that seamlessly blends performance, comfort,
and utility. Cloaked in a stunning blue exterior, this Transit Connect is
more than just a vehicle; it's a statement on wheels that promises to
elevate your business and daily drives to new heights.

Under the hood lies a robust 2.0L I4 engine, delivering a hearty 162
horsepower and 144 ft. lbs. of torque. This powerplant is perfectly
paired with an 8-speed shiftable automatic transmission that ensures
smooth and responsive shifts, giving you the ability to navigate through
traffic with ease and precision. Whether you're cruising on the highway
or maneuvering through tight city streets, the Transit Connect XL offers
the perfect blend of power and efficiency to get the job done.

Step inside, and you'll be greeted by a durable and easy-to-clean vinyl
interior. The unknown color palette provides a professional and sleek
ambiance, ensuring that you and your passengers or cargo ride in style.
The cabin is thoughtfully designed to be both functional and
comfortable, providing a mobile sanctuary from the hustle and bustle of
the workday.

The Ford Transit Connect XL is not just about getting from point A to
point B; it's about doing so with confidence and peace of mind. This
vehicle comes equipped with a suite of manufacturer options and
packages that enhance its utility and convenience. While the specifics of
these packages are not detailed here, rest assured that Ford's
commitment to innovation and customer satisfaction means that these
features are tailored to meet the demands of even the most discerning
drivers and professionals.

The Transit Connect XL is more than just a mode of transportation; it's
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The Transit Connect XL is more than just a mode of transportation; it's
a reliable partner for your business. Its compact size belies a spacious
and adaptable interior that can accommodate a variety of cargo needs.
Whether you're delivering packages, transporting equipment, or
providing services on the go, this vehicle is designed to support your
entrepreneurial spirit and drive your business forward.

Safety is paramount in the 2021 Ford Transit Connect XL. Ford's
dedication to safety is evident in every aspect of this vehicle's design,
ensuring that you can focus on the road ahead while being protected by
advanced safety features and robust construction.

Imagine the possibilities that await with the Ford Transit Connect XL as
your trusted companion. It's not just about the destinations you'll reach
but the journeys you'll enjoy along the way. With its striking blue
exterior, you'll turn heads and make a lasting impression, whether
you're pulling up to a client's location or parked at a job site.

Don't miss the opportunity to own this exceptional 2021 Ford Transit
Connect XL. It's more than a vehicle; it's a mobile command center that
empowers you to take on the challenges of the road and the demands
of your business with confidence and style. Visit us today for a test
drive, and experience firsthand how the Transit Connect XL can
revolutionize the way you work and drive. Your next adventure awaits,
and it begins with the turn of a key.
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Vehicle History Report : as Of 07/27/2024

*carfax Snapshot is a reflection of available information on the date the report was pulled. carfax
is constantly being updated with new information and is subject to change at any time.

 

Our Location :
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Snapshot

2021 FORD TRANSIT CONNECT XL

Accident reported: very minor damage

MINOR MODERATE SEVERE

6 Service history
records

11 Detailed records available

104,469 Last reported odometer
reading

FREE CARFAX Report

See the full CARFAX Report for additional information
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https://www.carfax.com/VehicleHistory/p/Report.cfx?partner=AVR_0&vin=NM0GE9E28M1489095&source=BUP
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Installed Options

Interior

- Air filtration - Front air conditioning: automatic climate control  

- Front air conditioning zones: dual  - Rear air conditioning: independently controlled  

- Door trim: cloth - Capless fuel filler system - Cruise control 

- Multi-function remote: keyless entry - Power outlet(s): 12V cargo area  - Power steering 

- Steering wheel: tilt and telescopic  - Sun visors - Clock - Digital odometer 

- External temperature display - Multi-function display - Trip odometer 

- Front seat type: bucket  - Passenger seat folding: folds flat  - Rear seat folding: flat  

- Rear seat type: bucket  - Third row seat folding: flat  

- Third row seat type: 50-50 split bench

Exterior

- Daytime running lights  - Spare wheel type: steel  - Tire Pressure Monitoring System 

- Wheels: painted steel - Front wipers: rain sensing  - Power windows: safety reverse  

- Rear wiper: intermittent - Solar-tinted glass - Window defogger: rear
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