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66 Auto Sales Price $36,966
Specifications:

Year:  2022  

VIN:  3TMCZ5AN8NM516086  

Make:  Toyota  

Stock:  20764  

Model/Trim:  Tacoma SR5 V6  

Condition:  Pre-Owned  

Body:  Pickup Truck  

Exterior:  White  

Engine:  3.5L V6 278hp 265ft. lbs.  

Interior:  Gray  

Transmission:  6-Speed Shiftable Automatic  

Mileage:  49,302  

Drivetrain:  4 Wheel Drive  

Economy:  City 18 / Highway 22

*****INTERNET SHOPPERS:  ASK FOR

OUR INTERNET SALESMAN KEVIN
GRANT JR TO ASSIST YOU WHEN YOU CALL OR ARRIVE
AT THE DEALERSHIP AND BECOME ELIGIBLE FOR ADDITIONAL
INCENTIVES AT THE TIME OF PURCHASE!! 

BROWSE MORE INFORMATION ABOUT OUR INVENTORY AT THE
66 AUTO SALES HOME WEBSITE:

WWW.66AUTOSALES.COM!!    [smiley]

 

Step into the realm of unbridled capability and unmistakable style with
the 2022 Toyota Tacoma SR5 V6, a midsize pickup that's earned its
stripes and the industry's respect. Dressed in a pristine white exterior
that exudes sophistication and durability, this Tacoma is more than just
a truck – it's a statement of reliability and power.

The heart of this machine is a robust 3.5L V6 engine, delivering a hefty
278 horsepower and 265 foot-pounds of torque. Whether you're towing,
hauling, or simply cruising down the highway, this engine, paired with a
seamless 6-Speed Shiftable Automatic transmission, offers the perfect
blend of efficiency and muscle. The Tacoma doesn't just make work
feel like play; it ensures every drive is an exhilarating experience.

Step inside to a spacious cabin where functionality meets comfort. The
interior, adorned in a versatile gray palette, awaits your personal touch
to become the command center for all your adventures. Though the
specifics of the interior material remain a mystery, rest assured that
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specifics of the interior material remain a mystery, rest assured that
Toyota's commitment to quality means a space that is both durable and
inviting, ready for the rigors of daily use or the spills of weekend
escapades.

The accolades speak for themselves. This Tacoma comes with a trophy
case of awards from Kelley Blue Book, including Best Buy: Midsize
Pickup Truck and Best Resale Value across multiple categories.
Owning this truck isn't just a smart choice for today; it's a strategic
investment for the future. With the Best Resale Value: Brand, Trucks,
and Top 10 Models, along with the Best Overall Truck Brand and 5-Year
Cost to Own: Best Brand awards, the 2022 Tacoma SR5 V6 stands as
a testament to lasting value and unwavering appeal.

But the merits don't end with raw power and financial wisdom. This
Tacoma is outfitted with a suite of manufacturer options and packages
that elevate every journey. While the specifics of these enhancements
are left to the imagination, one can anticipate a range of features that
bolster convenience, safety, and entertainment – all designed to enrich
your driving experience.

Imagine the possibilities as you sit behind the wheel, the envy of your
peers and the master of your domain. Whether it's navigating through
city streets with agility or conquering rugged terrain with confidence, the
Tacoma SR5 V6 is your trusted companion. It's a vehicle that doesn't
just meet expectations – it redefines them.

Don't miss the opportunity to own a piece of Toyota's legendary
engineering. This 2022 Tacoma SR5 V6 is more than just a truck; it's a
partner for life, a beacon of excellence in a world that demands nothing
less. Embrace the power, cherish the prestige, and enjoy the peace of
mind that comes with owning a vehicle that's built to outlast and
outperform. Your adventure awaits, and the 2022 Toyota Tacoma SR5
V6 is the key to unlocking it all.
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Installed Options

Interior

- Air filtration - Front air conditioning: automatic climate control  

- Front air conditioning zones: dual  - Steering wheel trim: leather - Adaptive cruise control  

- Multi-function remote: keyless entry - Power outlet(s): 12V front  

- Power steering: variable/speed-proportional - Rearview mirror: auto-dimming 

- Steering wheel: tilt and telescopic  - Sun visors - Clock - Digital odometer 

- External temperature display - Multi-function display - Trip odometer 

- Driver seat power adjustments: 10  - Front seat type: bucket  

- Rear seat folding: flip and fold  - Rear seat type: 60-40 split bench  - Upholstery: cloth

Exterior

- Front bumper color: body-color - Mirror color: body-color - Pickup bed light 

- Daytime running lights  - Front fog lights  - Side mirrors: heated  - Spare wheel type: steel  

- Tire Pressure Monitoring System - Wheels: painted aluminum alloy 

- Front wipers: variable intermittent - Pickup sliding rear window: power horizontal  

- Power windows - Rear privacy glass

*Not all buyers will qualify for posted rate. Please consult with our Internet Department to qualify your rate.

66 Auto Sales
66autosales.com
928-753-6600
1945 E Andy Devine
Kingman, AZ 86401
© 2024 AutoRevo - All rights reserved. - Powered by AutoRevo

https://66autosales.com/vehicle/7309624/2022-toyota-tacoma-sr5-v6-kingman-az-86401/7309624/ebrochure
file:////tmp/66autosales.com
tel:928-753-6600
https://autorevo.com/

	2022 Toyota Tacoma SR5 V6
	66 Auto Sales Price $36,966
	Specifications:
	Our Location :

	Installed Options
	Interior
	Exterior



