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Our Price $29,995
Specifications:

Year:  2014  

VIN:  3GCUKSEJ8EG460776  

Make:  Chevrolet  

Stock:  24148  

Model/Trim:  Silverado 1500 LTZ Z71  

Condition:  Pre-Owned  

Body:  Pickup Truck  

Exterior:  Black  

Engine:  EcoTec3 6.2L V8 420hp 460ft. lbs.  

Interior:  -  

Transmission:  6-Speed Shiftable Automatic w/Overdrive  

Mileage:  114,822  

Drivetrain:  4 Wheel Drive  

Economy:  City 14 / Highway 20

Step into the realm of rugged sophistication with our 2014 Chevrolet
Silverado 1500 LTZ Z71, a powerhouse of a pickup that combines
formidable performance with top-tier luxury. Coated in a sleek black
exterior, this Silverado makes a statement on the road with its
commanding presence and refined aesthetics. Having journeyed
114,822 miles, this vehicle is primed and ready for countless more,
promising to be a reliable companion for all your adventures.

Under the hood, you'll discover the heart of this beast – an EcoTec3
6.2L V8 engine that roars to life with an astounding 420 horsepower and
460 ft-lbs of torque. The strength of this engine is matched by its
intelligence; the 6-Speed Shiftable Automatic transmission with
Overdrive ensures that power is harnessed with precision, delivering a
driving experience that is as smooth as it is exhilarating.

As you step into the cabin, embrace the luxury that the LTZ trim offers.
The meticulously designed interior is not just a space – it's a sanctuary.
Premium materials and advanced technology envelop you, providing
comfort and connectivity at every turn. The Z71 package elevates the
driving experience further, offering enhancements designed for the off-
road enthusiast without compromising on refinement.

This Silverado isn't just a pleasure to drive; it's a smart investment. The
array of accolades it boasts is a testament to its enduring value and
appeal. Recognized by Edmunds as one of the Top 10 Best-Selling
Vehicles and Top 10 Least Expensive Trucks, this Silverado offers the
perfect blend of affordability and popularity. J.D. Power and Associates
have also honored it in their Automotive Performance, Execution and
Layout (APEAL) Study as a Top Model in its Segment, and in their
Vehicle Dependability Study (VDS) as a Top Model, reassuring you of
its exceptional quality and reliability.
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its exceptional quality and reliability.

Furthermore, Kelley Blue Book's accolades speak volumes about the
Silverado's worth, awarding it the Best Resale Value in both the Full-
Size Pickup and Top 10 Models categories, as well as recognizing
Chevrolet as the Best Styling Brand in their Brand Image Awards.
These honors guarantee that your investment will hold its value for
years to come, making it as wise as it is desirable.

Imagine yourself behind the wheel of this Silverado 1500 LTZ Z71,
towing with ease, cruising down highways, and conquering trails with
confidence. Whether you're heading to a job site, towing your boat to
the lake, or simply enjoying a night out on the town, this truck delivers
performance without sacrificing style or comfort.

Don't miss the opportunity to own a vehicle that has garnered such high
praise and proven its worth time and again. The 2014 Chevrolet
Silverado 1500 LTZ Z71 is more than just a truck – it's a statement of
strength, a commitment to quality, and a promise of adventures to
come. Contact us today to experience the power, luxury, and reliability
that this exceptional vehicle has to offer. Your journey awaits.
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Vehicle History Report : as Of 07/27/2024

*carfax Snapshot is a reflection of available information on the date the report was pulled. carfax
is constantly being updated with new information and is subject to change at any time.

 

Our Location :
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Snapshot

2014 CHEVROLET SILVERADO 1500 LTZ Z71

Damage reported: minor damage

MINOR MODERATE SEVERE

17 Service history
records

4 Previous owners

Personal
vehicle

114,822 Last reported odometer
reading

FREE CARFAX Report

See the full CARFAX Report for additional information

https://bleskinmotors.com/vehicle/7309453/2014-chevrolet-silverado-1500-ltz-z71-great-falls-montana-59405/7309453/ebrochure
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Installed Options

Interior

- Air filtration - Front air conditioning: automatic climate control  

- Front air conditioning zones: dual  - Floor mat material: rubber/vinyl - Floor mats: front 

- Steering wheel trim: leather - Cruise control - Memorized settings: 2 driver 

- Multi-function remote: keyless entry - Power outlet(s): 115V - Power steering 

- Rearview mirror: auto-dimming - Remote engine start - Steering wheel: tilt and telescopic  

- Universal remote transmitter: garage door opener  - Clock - Multi-function display 

- Trip odometer - Driver seat: heated  - Driver seat power adjustments: 10  

- Front seat type: 40-20-40 split bench  - Passenger seat: heated  

- Passenger seat power adjustments: 10  - Rear seat folding: folds up  

- Rear seat type: 60-40 split bench  - Upholstery: leather-trimmed

Exterior

- Body side moldings: chrome - Door handle color: chrome - Front bumper color: chrome 

- Mirror color: chrome - Pickup bed light - Tailgate: lift assist - Daytime running lights  

- Exterior entry lights: puddle lamps  - Front fog lights  - Side mirror adjustments: power 

- Side mirrors: driver side auto-dimming - Spare wheel type: steel  

- Tire Pressure Monitoring System - Wheels: aluminum alloy 

- Front wipers: variable intermittent - Pickup sliding rear window: power - Power windows 

- Tinted glass - Window defogger: rear
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