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Internet Price $25,900
Retail Value $26,900

Specifications:

Year:  2021  

VIN:  2C3CDZAG8MH594246  

Make:  Dodge  

Stock:  594246  

Model/Trim:  Challenger SXT  

Condition:  Pre-Owned  

Body:  Coupe  

Exterior:  [PX8] Pitch Black Clear Coat  

Engine:  Pentastar 3.6L V6 303hp 268ft. lbs.  

Interior:  Cloth  

Transmission:  8-Speed Shiftable Automatic  

Mileage:  35,589  

Drivetrain:  Rear Wheel Drive  

Economy:  City 19 / Highway 30

Autocheck One Owner!!

Ledet's Auto Sales proudly services every vehicle before the sale to
ensure customer satisfaction. All vehicles pass a specific multi-point
inspection before it goes to our lot. We also offer a number of different
warranties for our vehicles. Come by or call today to see what specials
we are offering!

**Step into the Thrilling Realm of Muscle with the 2021 Dodge
Challenger SXT**

Unleash the essence of raw power and undeniable style with this
captivating 2021 Dodge Challenger SXT. With a mere 35,589 miles on
the odometer, this automotive masterpiece in sleek black is a testament
to the Challenger's enduring legacy, a legacy that's been recognized
not once but twice with Kelley Blue Book's Brand Image Awards for
Best Styling Brand.

**Power and Grace Under the Hood**

Beneath the sculpted hood lies the heart of this beast – a robust
Pentastar 3.6L V6 engine producing an exhilarating 303 horsepower
and 268 ft-lbs of torque. It's a powertrain that offers a harmonious blend
of efficiency and performance, ensuring every drive is not just a journey,
but an adventure. Paired with an 8-speed shiftable automatic
transmission, the Challenger SXT delivers a driving experience that's
both responsive and smooth, giving you the power you crave with the
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both responsive and smooth, giving you the power you crave with the
refinement you deserve.

**Exterior Elegance Meets Interior Comfort**

As you approach this icon, the black exterior captivates the senses,
reflecting the Challenger's bold spirit and muscular lines. The design is
timeless, a perfect homage to its muscle car heritage, yet brimming with
modern sophistication. Slide into the cabin and be greeted by the plush
other cloth interior that envelopes you in comfort without sacrificing the
sporty aesthetic that the Challenger is known for. It's a space crafted for
those who appreciate the finer details while demanding a visceral
driving connection.

**Connectivity and Convenience at Your Fingertips**

Inside, the 2021 Challenger SXT is equipped with a suite of
technological features designed to enhance your driving experience.
The user-friendly interface ensures that your focus remains on the road
while keeping you connected to your world. It's a vehicle that doesn't
just understand the importance of performance but also the significance
of an intuitive, driver-centric environment.

**A Legacy of Style and Performance**

Owning a vehicle that's been honored with Kelley Blue Book's Brand
Image Awards for Best Styling Brand not once, but twice, speaks
volumes. It's not just a statement of the car's aesthetic appeal; it's a
testament to the Challenger's ability to capture and embody the very
soul of what a stylish performance car should be. The 2021 Dodge
Challenger SXT isn't just a mode of transportation; it's a piece of
automotive history, a symbol of American muscle, and a work of art on
wheels.

**Your Invitation to Experience Excellence**

This 2021 Dodge Challenger SXT isn't just a car; it's a lifestyle, a
statement, and an opportunity to join an elite group of enthusiasts who
know what it means to drive a legend. With its low mileage, powerful
engine, and award-winning style, this Challenger is primed to deliver an
exhilarating driving experience to its next proud owner.

Don't let this opportunity slip through your fingers. Contact us today to
schedule a test drive and feel the power, style, and legacy of the 2021
Dodge Challenger SXT for yourself. It's more than a car; it's your next
adventure waiting to happen.
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Vehicle History Report : as Of 05/18/2024

*carfax Snapshot is a reflection of available information on the date the report was pulled. carfax
is constantly being updated with new information and is subject to change at any time.

 

Our Location :
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Snapshot

2021 DODGE CHALLENGER SXT

No accidents or damage reported to
CARFAX

3 Service history
records

CARFAX 1-Owner
vehicle

Personal
vehicle

Last owned in Louisiana

18,231 Last reported odometer
reading

FREE CARFAX Report

See the full CARFAX Report for additional information

https://www.carfax.com/VehicleHistory/p/Report.cfx?partner=AVR_0&vin=2C3CDZAG8MH594246&source=BUP
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Installed Options

Interior

- Air filtration - Front air conditioning: automatic climate control  

- Front air conditioning zones: dual  - Humidity/dewpoint sensors - Rear vents: second row 

- Center console trim: alloy - Dash trim: alloy - Floor mat material: carpet - Floor mats: front 

- Interior accents: aluminum  - Shift knob trim: leather  - Steering wheel trim: leather 

- Cargo area light - Cruise control - Power outlet(s): 12V front  

- Power steering: variable/speed-proportional - Push-button start 

- Rearview mirror: auto-dimming - Steering wheel: tilt and telescopic  - Clock - Compass 

- Customizable instrument cluster - Digital odometer - External temperature display 

- Instrument cluster screen size: 7 in. - Multi-function display - Trip odometer 

- Front seat type: sport bucket  - Rear seat folding: split  - Rear seat type: 60-40 split bench  

- Upholstery: cloth

Exterior

- Exhaust: dual tip - Front bumper color: body-color - Mirror color: body-color 

- Rear spoiler: lip - Daytime running lights: LED - Exterior entry lights: approach lamps  

- Taillights: LED - Side mirrors: heated  - Spare tire kit: inflator kit  

- Tire Pressure Monitoring System - Wheels: painted aluminum alloy 

- Front wipers: variable intermittent - Power windows: safety reverse  - Solar-tinted glass 

- Window defogger: rear
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