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Our Price $12,995
Retail Value $14,995

Specifications:

Year:  2013  

VIN:  KMHGC4DD0DU236524  

Make:  Hyundai  

Stock:  T000041  

Model/Trim:  Genesis 3.8L  

Condition:  Pre-Owned  

Body:  Sedan  

Exterior:  Cabernet Red Pearl  

Engine:  3.8L V6 333hp 291ft. lbs.  

Interior:  Cashmere Leather  

Transmission:  8-Speed Shiftable Automatic  

Mileage:  75,275  

Drivetrain:  Rear Wheel Drive  

Economy:  City 18 / Highway 28

Step into the realm of luxury and performance with this captivating 2013
Hyundai Genesis 3.8L, a sedan that effortlessly blends sophistication
with power. With just 75,275 miles on the odometer, this striking red
beauty promises a driving experience that is as exhilarating as it is
reliable.

The Genesis's heart is a robust 3.8L V6 engine, delivering a
breathtaking 333 horsepower and 291 ft-lbs of torque, ensuring that
every acceleration is a pulse-pounding thrill. Mated to an 8-Speed
Shiftable Automatic transmission, this car offers smooth shifting and an
engaging drive that will make every journey memorable.

As you approach this stunning vehicle, the body-color front bumper and
dual-tip exhaust accentuate its sporty yet elegant stance. The mirror
color matches the body, adding to the seamless design, while chrome
accents on the door handles provide a touch of class. The aluminum
alloy wheels catch the light and the eyes of onlookers, while the heated
side mirrors ensure clear visibility on those chilly mornings.

Step inside, and you're greeted by an interior that exudes luxury. The
leather seats are not just a place to sit; they're a haven of comfort,
perfect for both spirited drives and long, leisurely journeys. The cabin's
ambiance is both welcoming and stylish, a testament to the Genesis's
commitment to excellence.

Technology and entertainment are at your fingertips, with a wireless
data link: Bluetooth for hands-free calls and streaming audio, keeping
you connected while on the move. The 6-speaker audio system,
complemented by a subwoofer, envelopes you in crystal-clear sound,
turning every drive into a private concert. Plus, with SiriusXM satellite
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turning every drive into a private concert. Plus, with SiriusXM satellite
radio and MP3 playback capabilities, your favorite tunes and talk shows
are always available.

Safety is paramount, and the Genesis doesn't disappoint. The Tire
Pressure Monitoring System keeps a vigilant eye on your wheels,
ensuring optimal performance and safety. The presence of front fog
lights and daytime running lights enhances visibility, providing an extra
layer of security.

This Genesis isn't just another car; it's a statement. It's no surprise that
it has been recognized by Edmunds as a Top Recommended Sedan
and has earned the title of Highest Ranked in J.D. Power and
Associates's Initial Quality Study (IQS). These accolades are a
testament to the vehicle's exceptional quality and the satisfaction it
delivers to its owners.

Imagine yourself behind the wheel of this 2013 Hyundai Genesis 3.8L,
the engine purring with untapped potential, the open road beckoning.
This is more than a car; it's a lifestyle, a symbol of taste and
discernment. Don't miss the opportunity to make this Genesis your own
and experience the perfect blend of luxury, performance, and
undeniable style. Visit us today, take the keys, and unlock the journey of
a lifetime.
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Vehicle History Report : as Of 06/27/2024

*carfax Snapshot is a reflection of available information on the date the report was pulled. carfax
is constantly being updated with new information and is subject to change at any time.

 

Our Location :

Snapshot

2013 HYUNDAI GENESIS 3.8L

Damage reported

23 Service history
records

2 Previous owners

Personal
vehicle

Last owned in Hawaii

75,275 Last reported odometer
reading

FREE CARFAX Report

See the full CARFAX Report for additional information
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Installed Options

Interior

- Air filtration - Front air conditioning: automatic climate control  

- Front air conditioning zones: dual  - Rear vents: second row - Center console trim: wood 

- Dash trim: wood - Door trim: wood - Shift knob trim: leather  - Steering wheel trim: leather 

- Ashtray - Cargo area light - Cruise control - Power outlet(s): two 12V front  - Power steering

- Push-button start - Rearview mirror: auto-dimming 

- Universal remote transmitter: Homelink - garage door opener  - Clock - Compass 

- Digital odometer - External temperature display - Multi-function display - Trip odometer 

- Driver seat: heated  - Driver seat power adjustments: 8  - Front seat type: bucket  

- Passenger seat: heated  - Rear seat folding - Rear seat type: 60-40 split bench  

- Upholstery: leather

Exterior

- Door handle color: body-color with chrome accents  - Exhaust: dual tip 

- Front bumper color: body-color - Mirror color: body-color - Daytime running lights  

- Front fog lights  - Side mirrors: heated  - Spare wheel type: steel  

- Tire Pressure Monitoring System - Wheels: aluminum alloy - Front wipers: speed sensitive

- Laminated glass: acoustic windshield  - Power windows: safety reverse  - Solar-tinted glass 

- Window defogger: rear
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