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66 Auto Sales Price $27,966
Specifications:

Year:  2019  

VIN:  1V2NR2CA1KC579639  

Make:  Volkswagen  

Stock:  20716A  

Model/Trim:  Atlas V6 SEL Premium 4Motion  

Condition:  Pre-Owned  

Body:  SUV  

Exterior:  Black  

Engine:  3.6L V6 276hp 266ft. lbs.  

Interior:  Black  

Transmission:  8-Speed Shiftable Automatic  

Mileage:  50,211  

Drivetrain:  All Wheel Drive  

Economy:  City 17 / Highway 23

*****INTERNET SHOPPERS:  ASK FOR

OUR INTERNET SALESMAN KEVIN
GRANT JR TO ASSIST YOU WHEN YOU CALL OR ARRIVE
AT THE DEALERSHIP AND BECOME ELIGIBLE FOR ADDITIONAL
INCENTIVES AT THE TIME OF PURCHASE!! 

BROWSE MORE INFORMATION ABOUT OUR INVENTORY AT THE
66 AUTO SALES HOME WEBSITE:

WWW.66AUTOSALES.COM!!    [smiley]

 

Step into the realm of refined comfort and commanding performance
with the 2019 Volkswagen Atlas V6 SEL Premium 4Motion, a vehicle
that effortlessly blends luxury with practicality to deliver an unparalleled
driving experience. With a modest 50,211 miles on the odometer, this
exquisite SUV is poised to take you on countless adventures without
missing a beat.

Dressed to impress in its sleek black exterior, this Atlas exudes a
presence of sophistication and strength that is matched only by its
equally elegant black interior. The cabin's exact material may be
shrouded in a touch of mystery, but rest assured, it envelops you in a
cocoon of style and comfort that Volkswagen is renowned for.

At the heart of this automotive masterpiece lies a robust 3.6L V6
engine, a powerhouse that generates an impressive 276 horsepower
and 266 ft. lbs. of torque. Mated to an 8-speed shiftable automatic
transmission, the Atlas delivers a smooth, responsive ride that makes
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transmission, the Atlas delivers a smooth, responsive ride that makes
both city navigation and highway cruising an absolute delight. The
4Motion all-wheel-drive system ensures that whether you're traversing
rain-soaked streets or exploring snow-covered trails, you'll have
unwavering traction and stability at your command.

The SEL Premium trim level is the pinnacle of the Atlas lineup, offering
a treasure trove of features that cater to your every need. From the
panoramic sunroof that bathes the interior in natural light to the
advanced safety systems that guard you and your loved ones, every
detail has been meticulously crafted to enhance your driving pleasure.

But don't just take our word for it—this Atlas has been honored with
Kelley Blue Book's Best Three-Row SUVs for Families and Best Family
Cars awards, a testament to its exceptional blend of space, comfort,
and reliability. It's a vehicle designed not just to meet expectations but
to surpass them, providing a sanctuary on wheels for you and your
family.

Imagine the confidence you'll feel behind the wheel, the admiring
glances as you pull up to the curb, and the peace of mind knowing
you're driving a vehicle that's been recognized for its family-friendly
attributes. The 2019 Volkswagen Atlas V6 SEL Premium 4Motion isn't
just an SUV; it's a statement—a declaration that you value quality,
safety, and an active lifestyle.

Don't let this opportunity pass you by. Embrace the chance to own a
vehicle that will turn every journey into a cherished memory. The 2019
Volkswagen Atlas V6 SEL Premium 4Motion is more than just a mode
of transportation; it's a companion that's ready to accompany you on
life's many roads.

Contact us today to schedule a test drive and experience firsthand the
allure of this magnificent SUV. The 2019 Volkswagen Atlas V6 SEL
Premium 4Motion is waiting to become a part of your family's story, to
be the vessel of your dreams and ambitions. Act now and take the first
step towards a driving experience that you'll treasure for years to come.
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Installed Options

Interior

- Air filtration - Front air conditioning: automatic climate control  

- Front air conditioning zones: dual  - Rear air conditioning: automatic climate control  

- Rear vents: third row - Floor mat material: carpet - Floor mats: front 

- Heated steering wheel - Interior accents: metallic/woodgrain  - Shift knob trim: leather  

- Steering wheel trim: leather - Active parking system: semi-automatic 

- Adaptive cruise control  - Adaptive stop and go cruise control: semi-automatic  

- Ambient lighting - Cargo area light - Footwell lights - Memorized settings: 3 driver 

- Power outlet(s): 115V rear  - Power steering: variable/speed-proportional - Push-button start

- Rearview mirror: auto-dimming - Remote engine start - Steering wheel: tilt and telescopic  

- Sunshade: side window - Universal remote transmitter: Homelink - garage door opener  

- Clock - Compass - Customizable instrument cluster - Digital odometer 

- External temperature display - Instrument cluster screen size: 12.3 in.  

- Multi-function display - Trip odometer - Driver seat: heated  

- Driver seat power adjustments: 10  - Front seat type: bucket  - Passenger seat: heated  

- Passenger seat power adjustments: 8  - Rear seat: heated  - Rear seat folding: flat  

- Rear seat type: 60-40 split bench  - Third row seat folding: flat  

- Third row seat type: 50-50 split bench  - Upholstery: leather-trimmed

Exterior

- Exhaust: dual tip - Front bumper color: body-color - Mirror color: body-color 

- Daytime running lights: LED - Exterior entry lights: approach lamps  

- Front fog lights: cornering  - Taillights: LED - Side mirror adjustments: power 

- Side mirrors: heated  - Roof rails: silver  - Spare wheel type: steel  

- Tire Pressure Monitoring System - Wheels: aluminum alloy - Front wipers: rain sensing  

- Heated windshield washer jets  - Rear privacy glass - Rear wiper: intermittent 

- Window defogger: rear
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*Not all buyers will qualify for posted rate. Please consult with our Internet Department to qualify your rate.
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