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Our Price $11,995
Specifications:

Year:  2019  

VIN:  1N4BL4BV4KC205814  

Make:  Nissan  

Stock:  2151  

Model/Trim:  Altima 2.5 S  

Condition:  Pre-Owned  

Body:  Sedan  

Exterior:  [KH3] Super Black  

Engine:  2.5L I4 188hp 180ft. lbs.  

Interior:  Charcoal Cloth  

Transmission:  Xtronic CVT  

Mileage:  119,290  

Drivetrain:  Front Wheel Drive  

Economy:  City 28 / Highway 39

Our Super Black 2019 Nissan Altima S Sedan is built to help you unlock
the pure joy of driving! Powered by a 2.5 Liter 4 Cylinder generating
188hp that's paired with an innovative Xtronic CVT for performance with
efficiency. This Front Wheel Drive sedan also delivers a refined ride with
responsive handling, and it achieves nearly 39mpg on the highway.
Dramatically styled, our Altima slips through the air with ease and
makes a lasting impression with its bold V-Motion grille, strong lines,
and athletic proportions, all set off by a sporty stance.

 

The roomy S cabin greets you with comfortable cloth seats, eight-way
power for the driver, a multifunction steering wheel, air conditioning,
remote start, and Nissan's Intelligent Key system with push-button
ignition. And there's no shortage of modern technology, since an
Advanced Drive-Assist Display, an 8-inch touchscreen, Android
Auto/Apple CarPlay, Bluetooth, and a six-speaker audio system are all
standard. Those are must-have features for today's drivers!

 

Nissan knows that peace of mind is important to you as well, and to
meet your demands, safety features such as a backup camera,
automatic braking, forward-collision warning, and a driver-attention
monitor are on board. Our beautiful Altima is a smart choice for sedan
lovers just like you! Save this Page and Call for Availability. We Know
You Will Enjoy Your Test Drive Towards Ownership! 

https://millennium2211.com/
tel:414-383-6666
https://millennium2211.com/vehicle/7305009/2019-nissan-altima-2-5-s-milwaukee-wisconsin-53215/7305009/ebrochure


2019 Nissan Altima 2.5 S 
Millennium Motor Sales - 414-383-6666 - View this car on our website at millennium2211.com/7305009/ebrochure

Our Location :

2019 Nissan Altima 2.5 S 
Millennium Motor Sales - 414-383-6666 - View this car on our website at millennium2211.com/7305009/ebrochure

Installed Options

Interior

- Air filtration - Front air conditioning  - Cargo area light - Cruise control 

- Power outlet(s): two 12V front  - Power steering: variable/speed-proportional 

- Push-button start - Remote engine start - Steering wheel: tilt and telescopic  - Clock 

- Customizable instrument cluster - Digital odometer - External temperature display 

- Instrument cluster screen size: 7 in. - Multi-function display - Trip odometer 

- Driver seat power adjustments: 8  - Front seat type: bucket  - Rear seat folding: split  

- Rear seat type: 60-40 split bench  - Upholstery: cloth

Exterior

- Active grille shutters - Door handle color: chrome - Exhaust: dual tip 

- Front bumper color: body-color - Mirror color: body-color - Side mirror adjustments: power 

- Spare wheel type: steel  - Tire Pressure Monitoring System - Wheels: steel 

- Front wipers: speed sensitive  - Window defogger: rear

*An additional $195.00 service fee will apply, not included in vehicle price*
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