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66 Auto Sales Price $21,966
Specifications:

Year:  2018  

VIN:  5XYZU4LA1JG567370  

Make:  Hyundai  

Stock:  20736  

Model/Trim:  SANTA FE Sport 2.0T  

Condition:  Pre-Owned  

Body:  SUV  

Exterior:  Gray  

Engine:  Theta II 2.0L Turbo I4 240hp 260ft. lbs.  

Interior:  Black Leather  

Transmission:  6-Speed Shiftable Automatic  

Mileage:  48,851  

Drivetrain:  Front Wheel Drive  

Economy:  City 20 / Highway 28

*****INTERNET SHOPPERS:  ASK FOR

OUR INTERNET SALESMAN KEVIN
GRANT JR TO ASSIST YOU WHEN YOU CALL OR ARRIVE
AT THE DEALERSHIP AND BECOME ELIGIBLE FOR ADDITIONAL
INCENTIVES AT THE TIME OF PURCHASE!! 

BROWSE MORE INFORMATION ABOUT OUR INVENTORY AT THE
66 AUTO SALES HOME WEBSITE:

WWW.66AUTOSALES.COM!!    [smiley]

 

Step into the realm of refined performance and indulge in the
exceptional driving experience offered by the 2018 Hyundai Santa Fe
Sport 2.0T, a vehicle that combines elegance with exhilarating power.
With only 48,851 miles on the odometer, this stunning gray masterpiece
is poised to deliver an adventure that's as fresh as its sleek and stylish
exterior suggests.

As you approach this automotive marvel, the sophisticated gray hue
captures the light with a subtle yet captivating allure, hinting at the
meticulous care this vehicle has received. The exterior design, with its
fluid lines and athletic stance, promises a dynamic drive that the Santa
Fe Sport 2.0T unequivocally delivers.

Opening the door reveals an interior sanctuary where black leather
seats await, ready to envelop you in comfort and luxury. The cabin's
craftsmanship is a testament to Hyundai's commitment to quality,
offering a tactile and visual feast that is as pleasing to the senses as it is
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offering a tactile and visual feast that is as pleasing to the senses as it is
to the soul. The leather's rich texture and the cabin's ergonomic layout
create an environment that is both inviting and intuitive, ensuring every
journey is enjoyed in supreme comfort.

At the heart of this exceptional vehicle lies the potent Theta II 2.0L
Turbo I4 engine, a powerhouse that generates an impressive 240
horsepower and 260 ft-lbs of torque. This turbocharged marvel
transforms every green light into an exhilarating escape, with smooth
acceleration that merges power and efficiency in a symphony of
engineering excellence. The 6-Speed Shiftable Automatic transmission
offers seamless shifts and the ability to take control when the mood
strikes, ensuring that you're always in the optimal gear for spirited drives
or relaxed cruising.

The Santa Fe Sport 2.0T is not just about performance; it's also about
peace of mind. As a recipient of Kelley Blue Book's 5-Year Cost to Own:
Best Brand award, you can be confident that this vehicle represents not
only a fantastic driving experience but also exceptional value. This
accolade reflects Hyundai's dedication to reliability, low maintenance
costs, and strong resale value, ensuring that your investment today will
continue to reward you for years to come.

This 2018 Hyundai Santa Fe Sport 2.0T is more than just a car; it's a
statement. It's for the discerning driver who demands power without
compromise, who craves luxury and comfort without the exorbitant price
tag. It's for the individual who understands that life is a journey best
traveled in style, safety, and with a touch of sportiness that makes
every drive an occasion.

Don't let this opportunity pass you by. Embrace the chance to own a
vehicle that stands out for all the right reasons, a car that has been
crafted with care and engineered to excite. The 2018 Hyundai Santa Fe
Sport 2.0T is waiting for you to start your next adventure. Will you
answer the call?
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Installed Options

Interior

- Air filtration: ionizing - Front air conditioning: automatic climate control  

- Front air conditioning zones: dual  - Rear vents: second row 

- Armrests: rear center folding with storage  - Door sill trim: aluminum - Door trim: cloth 

- Shift knob trim: leather  - Steering wheel trim: leather - Cargo area light - Cruise control 

- Power outlet(s): 12V cargo area  - Power steering - Push-button start 

- Rearview mirror: auto-dimming - Steering wheel: tilt and telescopic  

- Sunshade: side window - Universal remote transmitter: Homelink - garage door opener  

- Clock - Compass - Digital odometer - External temperature display - Multi-function display 

- Trip odometer - Driver seat: heated  - Front seat type: bucket  - Passenger seat: heated  

- Passenger seat power adjustments: 6  - Rear seat folding: flat  

- Rear seat type: 40-20-40 split bench  - Upholstery: leather

Exterior

- Door handle color: chrome - Exhaust: dual tip - Front bumper color: body-color 

- Mirror color: body-color - Rear spoiler: roofline - Daytime running lights: LED 

- Front fog lights  - Side mirrors: heated  - Roof rails: black  - Spare wheel type: steel  

- Tire Pressure Monitoring System - Wheels: aluminum alloy 

- Front wipers: variable intermittent - Power windows - Rear privacy glass 

- Rear wiper: intermittent - Solar-tinted glass: front - Window defogger: rear

*Not all buyers will qualify for posted rate. Please consult with our Internet Department to qualify your rate.
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