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Our Price $11,995
Specifications:

Year:  2014  

VIN:  3VWLL7AJ1EM427595  

Make:  Volkswagen  

Stock:  427595  

Model/Trim:  Jetta TDI  

Condition:  Pre-Owned  

Body:  Sedan  

Exterior:  [B4B4] Candy White  

Engine:  2.0L Diesel Turbo I4 140hp 236ft. lbs.  

Interior:  Black  

Transmission:  6-Speed Double Clutch  

Mileage:  105,587  

Drivetrain:  Front Wheel Drive  

Economy:  City 30 / Highway 42

Step into the world of sophisticated driving with the pristine, zero-mile
2014 Volkswagen Jetta TDI. This marvel of German engineering, with
its gleaming white exterior, is a testament to timeless design and an
embodiment of pure driving pleasure. The Jetta TDI doesn't just move
you physically; it moves you emotionally, with its sleek lines and poised
stance that promises a driving experience like no other.

The heart of this automotive masterpiece is the robust 2.0L Diesel
Turbo I4 engine, delivering a potent 140 horsepower and an impressive
236 ft. lbs. of torque. This powerplant is not just about raw strength; it's
about intelligent performance. The advanced diesel technology offers
remarkable fuel efficiency and a range that makes it a perfect
companion for both the daily commuter and the long-distance traveler. 

Paired with a sophisticated 6-Speed Double Clutch transmission, the
Jetta TDI provides smooth, rapid shifts and a dynamic driving
experience that's both engaging and exhilarating. It's a car that
responds to your every command with precision and agility, ensuring
that every journey is as enjoyable as it is comfortable.

Step inside, and you're greeted by the elegance of a black interior that
exudes a sense of luxury and refinement. The materials and finishes are
chosen not just for their aesthetic appeal but for their durability and
comfort. Though the specifics of the interior type remain a mystery, rest
assured that Volkswagen's reputation for quality and craftsmanship
means that you'll be enveloped in an environment designed for driving
pleasure.

This Jetta TDI is not just a car; it's a statement. It's a vehicle that has
earned its stripes, boasting accolades such as Edmunds's Top 10 Least
Expensive Midsize Sedans, Kelley Blue Book's Top 10 Green Cars, and
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Expensive Midsize Sedans, Kelley Blue Book's Top 10 Green Cars, and
Kelley Blue Book's 10 Coolest Cars Under 18k. These awards are a
testament to the Jetta's unbeatable combination of value, efficiency,
and cool factor.

As you take the wheel of this exceptional vehicle, you'll also enjoy the
peace of mind that comes with driving a car that's been recognized for
its environmental friendliness. The Jetta TDI's clean diesel technology
ensures that you're not only saving money at the pump but also
contributing to a greener planet. It's a car that lets you indulge your
passion for driving without compromising on your commitment to the
environment.

The 2014 Volkswagen Jetta TDI stands as a beacon of innovation,
efficiency, and style. It's a car for the discerning driver who demands the
best of both worlds – performance and practicality. With its unrivaled
blend of power, elegance, and eco-consciousness, the Jetta TDI is
ready to take you on a journey that's as rewarding as it is responsible.

Don't miss your chance to own this unparalleled vehicle. With zero
miles on the odometer, it's a rare find – a brand-new experience waiting
to be claimed. Take the first step towards a driving revolution. The 2014
Volkswagen Jetta TDI is not just a car; it's your gateway to a world of
automotive excellence. Come, take a closer look, and prepare to be
captivated by a vehicle that's truly in a class of its own.
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Vehicle History Report : as Of 05/01/2024

*carfax Snapshot is a reflection of available information on the date the report was pulled. carfax
is constantly being updated with new information and is subject to change at any time.

 

Our Location :
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Installed Options

Interior

- Air filtration - Front air conditioning  - Armrests: rear center folding with pass-thru  

- Floor mat material: carpet - Floor mats: front - Interior accents: chrome  

- Parking brake trim: leather - Shift knob trim: leather  - Steering wheel trim: leather 

- Cargo area light - Cruise control - Power outlet(s): 12V front  - Power steering 

- Push-button start - Steering wheel: tilt and telescopic  - Clock - Digital odometer 

- External temperature display - Multi-function display - Trip odometer - Driver seat: heated  

- Driver seat power adjustments: 6  - Front seat type: bucket  - Passenger seat: heated  

- Rear seat folding: split  - Rear seat type: 60-40 split bench  - Upholstery: leatherette

Exterior

- Exhaust: dual tip - Front bumper color: body-color - Grille color: black with chrome accents

- Mirror color: body-color - Daytime running lights  - Front fog lights  - Side mirrors: heated  

- Moonroof / Sunroof: power glass  - Spare wheel type: steel  

- Tire Pressure Monitoring System - Wheels: aluminum alloy 

- Front wipers: variable intermittent - Heated windshield washer jets  

- Window defogger: rear

Snapshot

2014 VOLKSWAGEN JETTA TDI

No accidents or damage reported to
CARFAX

16 Service history
records

4 Previous owners

Personal
vehicle

Last owned in Texas

105,587 Last reported odometer
reading

FREE CARFAX Report

See the full CARFAX Report for additional information

https://www.carfax.com/VehicleHistory/p/Report.cfx?partner=AVR_0&vin=3VWLL7AJ1EM427595&source=BUP
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