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Our Price $21,227
Retail Value $25,375

Specifications:

Year:  2020  

VIN:  4S3GKAU67L3612180  

Make:  Subaru  

Stock:  GP24178  

Model/Trim:  Impreza Limited  

Condition:  Pre-Owned  

Body:  Sedan  

Exterior:  [CBS] Crystal Black Silica  

Engine:  2.0L H4 152hp 145ft. lbs.  

Interior:  Black Leather  

Transmission:  7-Speed Shiftable CVT  

Mileage:  20,961  

Drivetrain:  All Wheel Drive  

Economy:  City 28 / Highway 36

BEST SELECTION OF
LOW MILE

GREAT VALUE
IMPORTS IN
ST. LOUIS!

< PROUD TO
PRESENT THIS >

<< 2020 SUBARU
IMPREZA LIMITED >>

https://autoportstl.com/
tel:636-394-0500
https://autoportstl.com/vehicle/7297788/2020-subaru-impreza-limited-ellisville-mo-63011/7297788/ebrochure


 

IMPREZA LIMITED >>
WHAT DO YOU WANT TO
KNOW:

<> WE WANT TO EARN YOUR
BUSINESS!

<> SALE PRICED FOR A FAST
SALE!

<> ONE OWNER NEW CAR
TRADE IN

<> SUPER LOW MILES!

<> POWER MOONROOF

<> HAS NEVER BEEN IN
ACCIDENT

<> SERVICE RECORDS

<> MUCH, MUCH MORE

Step into the realm of refined
elegance and unbridled
capability with the 2020 Subaru
Impreza Limited, a vehicle that's
not just a mode of transportation
but a statement of sophisticated
style and award-winning
reliability. With a mere 20,961
miles on the odometer, this gem
in sleek black is a testament to
meticulous care and minimal
wear.

As you approach the Impreza,
the black exterior promises a
timeless allure, a hue that
speaks volumes of its owner's



 

speaks volumes of its owner's
discerning taste. The allure
doesn't fade as you open the
door to reveal a luxurious black
leather interior that cradles you
in comfort and class. Every inch
of the cabin is designed with the
driver in mind, from the
ergonomically placed controls to
the soft touch materials that line
the space.

Under the hood lies the heart of
the Impreza, a robust 2.0L H4
engine that boasts 152
horsepower and 145 ft. lbs. of
torque, delivering a responsive
and exhilarating driving
experience. Paired with a 7-
Speed Shiftable CVT, this
vehicle offers seamless
transitions and optimized fuel
efficiency, allowing you to savor
every curve and straightaway
with confidence and ease.

The Impreza Limited doesn't just
stop at performance; it's also a
paragon of Subaru's commitment
to longevity and value. Earning
accolades such as Kelley Blue
Book's 5-Year Cost to Own: Best
Brand and Best Resale Value in
both the Brand and Compact Car
categories, this vehicle is a
smart investment for the
discerning buyer. Recognized as



 

discerning buyer. Recognized as
the Best Overall Brand and Most
Trusted Brand, Subaru's
reputation for durability and
performance is embodied in
every aspect of the Impreza.

But what truly sets this vehicle
apart is its symphony of
manufacturer options and
packages, meticulously curated
to enhance your driving
experience. The Impreza Limited
is equipped with the latest in
automotive technology and
convenience features, ensuring
every journey is as enjoyable as
the destination itself.

Imagine yourself behind the
wheel, the purr of the engine a
subtle promise of the adventures
to come. The road stretches out
before you, and with the Impreza
Limited, you're not just equipped
to tackle it — you're destined to
conquer it. Whether navigating
the urban jungle or exploring the
great outdoors, this vehicle is
your steadfast companion, ready
to rise to any occasion.

Opportunities like this don't
come often. The 2020 Subaru
Impreza Limited is a vehicle that
caters to those who seek more
than just a car — they seek a



 

than just a car — they seek a
companion for life's journeys, a
badge of honor, and a sanctuary
on wheels. Don't let this chance
slip through your fingers.
Embrace the opportunity to own
not just a car, but a legacy.
Come experience the 2020
Subaru Impreza Limited today,
and drive home a winner in
every sense of the word.

WHAT DO YOU WANT TO GO:

<> MISSOURI STATE SAFETY
INSPECTED

<> FEDERAL EMISSION TEST
COMPLETED

<> READY FOR IMMEDIATE
DELIVERY

<> CREDIT UNION FINANCING
AVAILABLE

<> LOW COMPETITIVE RATES
FOR ALL CREDIT SITUATIONS

<> COMPREHENSIVE
EXTENDED WARRANTY
AVAILABLE

<> WE CAN ASSIST WITH
NATIONWIDE SHIPPING

<> DON'T DELAY >> CALL,
TEXT, EMAIL, OR FACEBOOK
TODAY!!

<> TEXT OR CALL



 

<> TEXT OR CALL
GORDON FOR A QUICK
RESPONSE 314-229-8205

<> TEXT OR CALL TODAY TO
SET AN APPOINTMENT FOR A
PERSONAL VIEWING & TEST
RIDE
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Vehicle History Report : as Of 07/28/2024

*carfax Snapshot is a reflection of available information on the date the report was pulled. carfax
is constantly being updated with new information and is subject to change at any time.

 

Our Location :

2020 Subaru Impreza Limited 
AutoPort - 636-394-0500 - View this car on our website at autoportstl.com/7297788/ebrochure

Snapshot

2020 SUBARU IMPREZA LIMITED

Accident reported: minor to moderate damage

MINOR MODERATE SEVERE

8 Service history
records

CARFAX 1-Owner
vehicle

Personal lease
vehicle

21,154 Last reported odometer
reading

FREE CARFAX Report

See the full CARFAX Report for additional information

https://autoportstl.com/vehicle/7297788/2020-subaru-impreza-limited-ellisville-mo-63011/7297788/ebrochure
https://www.carfax.com/VehicleHistory/p/Report.cfx?partner=AVR_0&vin=4S3GKAU67L3612180&source=BUP
https://autoportstl.com/vehicle/7297788/2020-subaru-impreza-limited-ellisville-mo-63011/7297788/ebrochure


Installed Options

Interior

- Air filtration - Front air conditioning: automatic climate control  

- Center console trim: leatherette - Door trim: leatherette - Floor mat material: carpet 

- Floor mats: front - Interior accents: chrome  - Shift knob trim: leather  

- Steering wheel trim: leather - Adaptive cruise control  

- Adaptive stop and go cruise control: semi-automatic  - Power outlet(s): two 12V front  

- Power steering: variable/speed-proportional - Push-button start 

- Steering wheel: tilt and telescopic  - Clock - Digital odometer - External temperature display

- Multi-function display - Trip odometer - Driver seat: heated  

- Driver seat power adjustments: 6  - Front seat type: bucket  - Passenger seat: heated  

- Rear seat folding: split  - Rear seat type: 60-40 split bench  - Upholstery: leather-trimmed 

- Upholstery accents: contrast stitching

Exterior

- Active grille shutters - Door handle color: chrome - Front bumper color: body-color 

- Grille color: black with chrome accents  - Mirror color: body-color - Daytime running lights  

- Exterior entry lights: approach lamps  - Front fog lights: LED - Side mirrors: heated  

- Spare wheel type: steel  - Tire Pressure Monitoring System 

- Wheels: painted aluminum alloy - Front wipers: variable intermittent 

- Heated windshield wiper rests - Laminated glass: acoustic windshield  

- Power windows: safety reverse  - Tinted glass - Window defogger: rear

<p> <strong><em><font size="2">We offer comprehensive extended warranties.&nbsp; Please call for prices</font></em></strong></p> <p> <strong><em><font size="2">We offer

competitive financing.&nbsp; Please call&nbsp;to apply</font></em></strong></p>
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