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Sales Price $0
Specifications:

Year:  2022  

VIN:  KL79MTSL0NB038065  

Make:  Chevrolet  

Stock:  038065  

Model/Trim:  Trailblazer RS  

Condition:  Pre-Owned  

Body:  SUV  

Exterior:  Mosaic Black Metallic  

Engine:  ECOTEC 1.3L Turbo I3 155hp 174ft. lbs.  

Interior:  Jet Black/Red Accent Cloth  

Transmission:  CVT  

Mileage:  28,959  

Drivetrain:  Front Wheel Drive  

Economy:  City 29 / Highway 33

Prepare to command the road with the exhilarating 2022 Chevrolet
Trailblazer RS, a vehicle that masterfully combines style, performance,
and versatility. With a mere 28,959 miles on the odometer, this
Trailblazer is just revving up to showcase its prowess to a discerning
driver like you.

The sleek black exterior is a statement of sophistication and power,
making this Trailblazer RS an absolute head-turner wherever it roams.
Its bold stance and aggressive design cues are not just for aesthetics;
they embody the spirit of adventure that awaits you behind the wheel.

Step inside and be enveloped in the sporty yet comfortable black cloth
interior that beckons you to take a seat and experience the thrill of the
drive. The meticulously crafted cabin is designed to cater to your
comfort while reflecting the dynamic personality of the Trailblazer RS.

Under the hood lies the heart of this beast – an ECOTEC 1.3L Turbo I3
engine that generates a robust 155 horsepower and 174 ft-lbs of torque.
This powerhouse is paired with a seamless CVT transmission that
ensures smooth acceleration and responsive handling, making every
drive an exhilarating performance.

But the Trailblazer RS isn't just about raw power; it's also about
intelligent engineering. The manufacturer options and packages
included with this vehicle are tailored to enhance your driving
experience, ensuring that every journey is as enjoyable as it is
memorable.

Imagine yourself navigating city streets with effortless agility or cruising
down the highway with the confidence that comes from driving a vehicle
built to perform. The 2022 Chevrolet Trailblazer RS delivers a driving
experience that is both dynamic and efficient, thanks to its turbocharged
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experience that is both dynamic and efficient, thanks to its turbocharged
engine and advanced transmission.

Safety is paramount, and this Trailblazer RS is equipped with state-of-
the-art features designed to protect you and your passengers. You'll
drive with peace of mind knowing that Chevrolet's commitment to safety
is built into every inch of this vehicle.

The 2022 Chevrolet Trailblazer RS is the perfect companion for those
who demand more from their vehicle – more excitement, more
performance, and more style. It's a vehicle that stands out from the
crowd, not just for its stunning looks but for the way it makes you feel
when you're behind the wheel.

Don't miss the opportunity to own this exceptional Trailblazer RS. It's a
vehicle that promises to deliver an unmatched driving experience, and
it's waiting for you to take the lead. Act now and take the first step
towards owning the road with the 2022 Chevrolet Trailblazer RS –
where every drive is an adventure waiting to happen.
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Installed Options

Interior

- Air filtration - Front air conditioning  - Rear vents: second row - Floor mat material: carpet 

- Floor mats: front - Heated steering wheel - Shift knob trim: chrome  

- Steering wheel trim: leather - Cargo area light - Cruise control - Power outlet(s): 12V front  

- Power steering - Push-button start - Remote engine start 

- Steering wheel: tilt and telescopic  - Clock - Compass - Digital odometer 

- External temperature display - Multi-function display - Trip odometer - Driver seat: heated  

- Driver seat power adjustments: 8  - Front seat type: bucket  - Passenger seat: heated  

- Passenger seat folding: folds flat  - Rear seat folding: flat  

- Rear seat type: 40-60 split bench  - Upholstery: cloth 

- Upholstery accents: contrast stitching

Exterior

- Active grille shutters - Exhaust: dual tip - Front bumper color: body-color 

- Paint: contrast roof - Rear spoiler: roofline - Daytime running lights: LED 

- Exterior entry lights: approach lamps  - Front fog lights: LED - Taillights: LED 

- Side mirrors: heated  - Roof rails: black  - Spare wheel type: steel  

- Tire Pressure Monitoring System - Wheels: painted aluminum alloy 

- Front wipers: variable intermittent - Power windows: safety reverse  - Rear privacy glass 

- Rear wiper: intermittent - Solar-tinted glass - Window defogger: rear

All prices listed are CASH Discounted Prices plus tax, title, license and fees.
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