
2018 Subaru Forester 2.5i Premium

Our Price $11,995

View this vehicle on our website at dakotamotor.com

(651) 460-6655 
22098 Canton Court , Farmington, MN 55024
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Specifications:

Year:  2018  

VIN:  JF2SJAEC4JH577276  

https://dakotamotor.com/2018 Subaru Forester 2.5i Premium/7296732
https://dakotamotor.com
tel:(651) 460-6655


Make:  Subaru  

Model/Trim:  Forester 2.5i Premium  

Condition:  Pre-Owned  

Body:  Wagon  

Exterior:  [QBP] Quartz Blue Pearl  

Engine:  2.5L H4 170hp 174ft. lbs.  

Interior:  Gray Cloth  

Transmission:  CVT  

Mileage:  134,328  

Drivetrain:  All Wheel Drive

Vehicle Description

MOONROOF!!ALL WHEEL DRIVE!!CALL 651-460-6655

Check out our full line of inventory at DAKOTAMOTOR.COM

Call us anytime and ask for Bart or David and we will be happy to assist you. For your convenience please call before you come to be certain of
availability.  Full financing available. All of our vehicles have been checked by our in house service department. All of our vehicles are clean title and
have actual miles. Enjoy our low overhead low price philosophy. We buy in bulk and sell at wholesale cost to save you the new car store markup!!
30years in wholesaling makes us retailing’s smartest choice for a price savvy saver.

**Discover Adventure with the 2018 Subaru Forester 2.5i Premium**

Embark on a journey of comfort, reliability, and power with the 2018 Subaru Forester 2.5i Premium, dressed in a captivating blue hue that mirrors the
endless sky. This exceptional vehicle is not just a means of transportation; it's a trusted companion ready to navigate the roads of life with you.

Under the hood lies the heart of this rugged adventurer: a robust 2.5L H4 engine, delivering a spirited 170 horsepower and 174 ft. lbs. of torque,
ensuring that you have the power to conquer any terrain with ease. Paired with a seamless CVT transmission, the Forester offers a harmonious blend
of efficiency and responsiveness, making every journey as smooth as the first.

Step inside, and you're greeted by a spacious and inviting gray cloth interior that provides a serene oasis from the outside world. The cabin is crafted
with comfort in mind, from the supportive seats to the intuitively arranged controls, all designed to make your driving experience as enjoyable as
possible.

The Subaru Forester 2.5i Premium is not just a vehicle; it's a statement of trust. With accolades like J.D. Power and Associates's Vehicle
Dependability Study (VDS) Top Models award and Kelley Blue Book's Brand Image Awards for Most Trusted Brand, you can drive with the utmost
confidence, knowing that you're behind the wheel of one of the most reliable and esteemed vehicles on the road.

Manufacturer options and packages on this Forester elevate the driving experience to new heights. The attention to detail and commitment to quality
are evident in every aspect of this vehicle. Whether you're navigating city streets or exploring off the beaten path, the Forester is equipped to enhance
every moment behind the wheel.

The 2018 Subaru Forester 2.5i Premium is more than just a car; it's a promise of adventure, a beacon of dependability, and a testament to the joy of
driving. Its striking exterior is matched by an interior and mechanical prowess that stand the test of time. With this Forester, you're not just purchasing
a vehicle; you're investing in a lifestyle that values freedom, reliability, and enjoyment.

Imagine the places you'll go and the memories you'll create with the Forester as your faithful companion. Whether it's a spontaneous road trip, a daily
commute, or a weekend getaway, this vehicle is ready to deliver an exceptional driving experience.

Don't let this opportunity pass you by. The 2018 Subaru Forester 2.5i Premium is waiting to start its next chapter with you. With its award-winning
pedigree, superb craftsmanship, and unwavering performance, it's poised to sell quickly. Seize the moment and take the first step towards a future
filled with adventure and peace of mind.

Contact us today to schedule a test drive and feel the excitement for yourself. Your new journey awaits with the 2018 Subaru Forester 2.5i Premium –
where every drive is a promise of discovery.



Installed Options

Interior

- Air filtration - Front air conditioning: automatic climate control  - Floor mat material: carpet

- Floor mats: front - Ambient lighting - Cargo area light - Cruise control 

- Multi-function remote: keyless entry - Power outlet(s): cargo area 

- Power steering: variable/speed-proportional - Steering wheel: tilt and telescopic  - Clock 

- Digital odometer - External temperature display - Multi-function display - Trip odometer 

- Driver seat power adjustments: 10  - Front seat type: bucket  - Rear seat folding: split  

- Rear seat type: 60-40 split bench  - Upholstery: cloth

Exterior

- Front bumper color: body-color - Grille color: black with chrome accents  

- Mirror color: body-color - Rear spoiler: roofline - Daytime running lights  - Roof rails: black

- Spare wheel type: steel  - Tire Pressure Monitoring System - Wheels: aluminum alloy 

- Front wipers: variable intermittent - Laminated glass: acoustic windshield  

- Power windows: safety reverse  - Rear privacy glass - Rear wiper: auto-on in reverse  

- Tinted glass - Window defogger: rear

Dakota Motor Company

Dakota Motor Company

View this car on our website at dakotamotor.com/7296732

Website: dakotamotor.com

Phone: (651) 460-6655

Map: 22098 Canton Court, Farmington, MN 55024
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