
2016 Honda Pilot EX-L

Our Price $17,995

View this vehicle on our website at dakotamotor.com

(651) 460-6655 
22098 Canton Court , Farmington, MN 55024
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Specifications:

Year:  2016  

VIN:  5FNYF6H52GB048843  

https://dakotamotor.com/2016 Honda Pilot EX-L/7289671
https://dakotamotor.com
tel:(651) 460-6655


Make:  Honda  

Model/Trim:  Pilot EX-L  

Condition:  Pre-Owned  

Body:  SUV  

Exterior:  [BK] Crystal Black Pearl  

Engine:  3.5L V6 280hp 262ft. lbs.  

Interior:  Gray Leather  

Transmission:  6-Speed Shiftable Automatic  

Mileage:  97,532  

Drivetrain:  All Wheel Drive  

Economy:  City 18 / Highway 26

Vehicle Description

LEATHER!!MOONROOF!!ALL WHEEL DRIVE!!THIRD ROW SEATING!!CALL 651-460-6655

Check out our full line of inventory at DAKOTAMOTOR.COM

Call us anytime and ask for Bart or David and we will be happy to assist you. For your convenience please call before you come to be certain of
availability.  Full financing available. All of our vehicles have been checked by our in house service department. All of our vehicles are clean title and
have actual miles. Enjoy our low overhead low price philosophy. We buy in bulk and sell at wholesale cost to save you the new car store markup!!
30years in wholesaling makes us retailing’s smartest choice for a price savvy saver.

**Discover the Epitome of Sophistication and Reliability: The 2016 Honda Pilot EX-L**

Embark on an adventure in style with the exquisite 2016 Honda Pilot EX-L, a vehicle that merges the elegance of a black exterior with the luxurious
comfort of a gray leather interior. This remarkable SUV is not only a feast for the eyes but also a testament to Honda's commitment to excellence,
boasting a mere 97,532 miles on the odometer. The Pilot EX-L, with its potent 3.5L V6 engine delivering a robust 280 horsepower and 262 lb-ft of
torque, promises a driving experience that's as exhilarating as it is smooth, thanks to its 6-speed shiftable automatic transmission.

The 2016 Honda Pilot EX-L is a paragon of automotive achievement, as proven by its impressive collection of accolades. It is the proud recipient of
Edmunds's Best Retained Value: Honorable Mention, Top 10 Family Vehicles, Top Rated SUVs, and Top Recommended SUVs, not to mention Kelley
Blue Book's Best Buy: Midsize SUV, Brand Image Awards: Best Value Brand, and Best Family Cars. These prestigious awards are a clear indication
that this SUV is not just a vehicle but a wise investment for the discerning driver.

As you slide into the Pilot EX-L, you're enveloped in a cabin that is both spacious and refined. The gray leather seats offer a touch of class and ensure
comfort for all passengers, whether you're embarking on a cross-country journey or simply navigating the urban jungle. The meticulous attention to
detail is evident in every stitch, and the quality of materials used throughout the cabin speaks volumes about the care and craftsmanship that Honda
invests in every vehicle.

The 2016 Honda Pilot EX-L is not just about looks and comfort; it's also about practicality and performance. The powerful V6 engine ensures that you
have the power you need when you need it, whether you're overtaking on the highway or climbing a steep hill. The 6-speed shiftable automatic
transmission allows you to take control when the mood strikes, offering an engaging driving experience that's rare in vehicles of this class.

This SUV is not merely a mode of transportation; it's a sanctuary on wheels. The Pilot EX-L comes with a plethora of manufacturer options and
packages that enhance its versatility and convenience. Every journey becomes a pleasure, whether you're enjoying a solo drive or taking your family
on a weekend getaway. The Pilot EX-L is designed to cater to your every need, ensuring that every trip is as enjoyable as the destination.

The 2016 Honda Pilot EX-L is a vehicle that doesn't just meet expectations—it surpasses them. It's a testament to Honda's unwavering dedication to
quality, reliability, and customer satisfaction. When you choose the Pilot EX-L, you're not just buying an SUV; you're investing in a lifestyle. A lifestyle
that promises adventure, luxury, and peace of mind.

Don't miss the opportunity to own this extraordinary SUV. The 2016 Honda Pilot EX-L is waiting to take you on a journey of a lifetime. With its perfect
blend of style, comfort, and performance, it's an investment that continues to give back. Come, take the wheel, and experience the pinnacle of driving
pleasure. Your adventure awaits.



Installed Options

Interior

- Air filtration - Front air conditioning: automatic climate control  

- Front air conditioning zones: dual  - Rear air conditioning: automatic climate control  

- Floor mat material: carpet - Floor mats: front - Steering wheel trim: leather 

- Capless fuel filler system - Cargo area light - Conversation mirror - Cruise control 

- Multi-function remote: proximity entry system - Power outlet(s): 12V cargo area  

- Power steering - Push-button start - Rearview mirror: auto-dimming - Remote engine start

- Steering wheel: tilt and telescopic  

- Universal remote transmitter: Homelink - garage door opener  - Clock - Compass 

- Digital odometer - External temperature display - Multi-function display - Trip odometer 

- Driver seat: heated  - Driver seat power adjustments: 10  - Front seat type: bucket  

- Passenger seat: heated  - Rear seat folding: flat  - Rear seat type: 60-40 split bench  

- Third row seat folding: flat  - Third row seat type: 40-60 split bench  

- Upholstery: leather-trimmed

Exterior

- Front bumper color: body-color - Mirror color: body-color - Rear spoiler: roofline 

- Daytime running lights: LED - Front fog lights  - Taillights: LED - Side mirrors: heated  

- Spare wheel type: steel  - Tire Pressure Monitoring System - Wheels: aluminum alloy 

- Front wipers: variable intermittent - Laminated glass: acoustic windshield  

- Power windows: safety reverse  - Rear privacy glass - Rear wiper: intermittent 

- Window defogger: rear

Dakota Motor Company

Dakota Motor Company

View this car on our website at dakotamotor.com/7289671

Website: dakotamotor.com

Phone: (651) 460-6655

Map: 22098 Canton Court, Farmington, MN 55024
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