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Our Price $15,995
Specifications:

Year:  2012  

VIN:  1GCPKTE78CF145885  

Make:  Chevrolet  

Stock:  24056  

Model/Trim:  Silverado 1500 LTZ  

Condition:  Pre-Owned  

Body:  Pickup Truck  

Exterior:  White  

Engine:  Vortec 5.3L Flex Fuel V8 315hp 335ft. lbs.  

Interior:  -  

Transmission:  6-Speed Shiftable Automatic  

Mileage:  178,256  

Drivetrain:  4 Wheel Drive  

Economy:  City 11 / Highway 16

Step into the realm of robust power and refined luxury with our 2012
Chevrolet Silverado 1500 LTZ, a true testament to American
engineering and dependability. Cloaked in a pristine white exterior, this
Silverado exudes a sense of strength and purity that's rare in a truck
that's seen the road as much as this one has. With 178,256 miles on the
odometer, this vehicle has proven its reliability and is poised to take on
countless more adventures.

At the heart of this mechanical marvel lies the Vortec 5.3L Flex Fuel V8
engine, a powerhouse that churns out an impressive 315 horsepower
and 335 ft. lbs. of torque. Paired with a smooth-shifting 6-Speed
Shiftable Automatic transmission, this Silverado delivers a driving
experience that's both exhilarating and efficient, allowing you to tackle
any task with ease.

The LTZ trim level means you're indulging in the pinnacle of comfort
and convenience. The Silverado 1500 LTZ doesn't just work hard; it
pampers you with every mile. Inside, you'll find a cabin rich with
amenities and crafted with meticulous attention to detail. From the
premium leather seats that provide both support and comfort during
long hauls to the advanced technology that keeps you connected and in
control, this truck doesn't just meet expectations—it exceeds them.

But don't just take our word for it. The 2012 Chevrolet Silverado has
been showered with accolades, including making Edmunds's Top 10
lists for Least Expensive Trucks, Most Fuel-Efficient Trucks, and Best-
Selling Vehicles. These awards underscore the Silverado's value,
efficiency, and popularity, ensuring that you're making a wise
investment that's recognized by industry experts.

Moreover, the Silverado has earned a spot in the J.D. Power and
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Moreover, the Silverado has earned a spot in the J.D. Power and
Associates's Vehicle Dependability Study (VDS), ranking as one of the
Top Models. This honor is a testament to the Silverado's long-lasting
durability and quality, giving you peace of mind that this truck is built to
stand the test of time.

Imagine yourself behind the wheel, commanding this white knight of the
road with confidence, knowing that your Silverado is not just a means of
transportation, but a steadfast partner in your daily endeavors. Whether
you're hauling heavy loads, navigating treacherous terrain, or simply
cruising down the highway, the 2012 Chevrolet Silverado 1500 LTZ
responds with grace and agility.

This is more than just a truck—it's a statement. It's a declaration of your
commitment to excellence, reliability, and an unyielding work ethic.
Owning this Silverado means you're part of an elite group of individuals
who demand the best from their vehicles and themselves.

Don't miss the opportunity to make this 2012 Chevrolet Silverado 1500
LTZ yours. Embrace the power, embrace the luxury, embrace the
legacy. Visit us today and experience firsthand the unparalleled
combination of performance and sophistication that only this Silverado
can offer. Your next chapter of road dominance awaits.
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Vehicle History Report : as Of 05/19/2024

*carfax Snapshot is a reflection of available information on the date the report was pulled. carfax
is constantly being updated with new information and is subject to change at any time.

 

Our Location :

2012 Chevrolet Silverado 1500 LTZ 

Snapshot

2012 CHEVROLET SILVERADO 1500 LTZ

Damage reported: very minor damage

MINOR MODERATE SEVERE

6 Service history
records

At least 1 open
recall

5 Previous owners

178,256 Last reported odometer
reading

FREE CARFAX Report

See the full CARFAX Report for additional information
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Installed Options

Interior

- Front air conditioning: automatic climate control  - Front air conditioning zones: dual  

- Floor mat material: rubber/vinyl - Floor mats: front - Steering wheel trim: leather 

- Cruise control - Memorized settings: driver seat - Multi-function remote: keyless entry 

- Power outlet(s): 12V - Power steering - Push-button start - Rearview mirror: auto-dimming 

- Remote engine start - Trip odometer - Driver seat: heated  

- Driver seat power adjustments: 10  - Front seat type: bucket  - Passenger seat: heated  

- Passenger seat power adjustments: 10  - Rear seat folding: folds up  

- Rear seat type: 60-40 split bench  - Upholstery: leather-trimmed

Exterior

- Front bumper color: body-color - Pickup bed light - Daytime running lights  - Front fog lights

- Side mirror adjustments: power - Side mirrors: driver side auto-dimming 

- Spare wheel type: steel  - Tire Pressure Monitoring System 

- Wheels: chrome aluminum alloy - Power windows - Tinted glass - Window defogger: rear
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