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Price $41,590
Specifications:

Year:  2021  

VIN:  JTJAM7BX2M5298200  

Make:  Lexus  

Stock:  298200  

Model/Trim:  GX 460 Base  

Condition:  Pre-Owned  

Body:  SUV  

Exterior:  [202] Black Onyx  

Engine:  4.6L V8 301hp 329ft. lbs.  

Interior:  Red Leatherette  

Transmission:  6-Speed Automatic w/Sequential Shift
Mode

 

Mileage:  41,351  

Drivetrain:  All Wheel Drive  

Economy:  City 15 / Highway 19

Step into the realm of luxurious adventure with the 2021
Lexus GX 460 Base, a masterpiece of engineering and
design that merges the rugged capability of an off-road
conqueror with the sophistication of a luxury chariot. With
only 41,351 miles on the odometer, this black beauty is
poised to deliver unparalleled driving experiences to those
who demand excellence and prestige in every journey.

At first glance, the GX 460's striking black exterior exudes a
commanding presence, hinting at its ability to navigate
through life's twists and turns with grace and confidence. The
allure of adventure is matched by an interior that cradles you
in red leatherette seats, creating a bold statement that speaks
volumes of your taste for the finer things in life. The carefully
stitched upholstery is not just a seat but a throne from which
you rule the road, enveloped in comfort that makes every
mile a serene escape from the mundane.

Beneath the hood lies the heart of this majestic beast: a
robust 4.6L V8 engine that pumps out an impressive 301
horsepower and 329 ft. lbs. of torque. This powerhouse
ensures that whether you're cruising down the highway or
forging a new path off the beaten track, you have the strength
and agility at your command. Paired with a 6-Speed
Automatic transmission with Sequential Shift Mode, the GX
460 offers a driving experience that is both exhilarating and
smooth, giving you the power to navigate life's challenges
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smooth, giving you the power to navigate life's challenges
with ease and finesse.

The GX 460 is not just about raw power; it's a technological
marvel, outfitted with manufacturer options and packages that
cater to your every need. Every detail has been meticulously
crafted to enhance your driving pleasure, ensuring that you
are always in control, connected, and comfortable.

As a testament to its enduring value and quality, the 2021
Lexus GX 460 has earned the Kelley Blue Book's Brand
Image Awards for Most Trusted Luxury Brand and the 5-Year
Cost to Own: Best Luxury Brand. These accolades are not
just awards; they are promises of reliability, trust, and cost-
effectiveness that Lexus delivers to its discerning customers.

Imagine yourself behind the wheel, the purr of the V8 engine
a harmonious backdrop to your daily commute or weekend
getaways. The world is yours to explore, and the GX 460 is
your loyal companion, ready to take on any challenge with
poise and power. The seamless blend of off-road tenacity and
on-road elegance makes this vehicle a rare find, a jewel in
the automotive landscape that stands out for its ability to
provide both thrills and tranquility.

This 2021 Lexus GX 460 Base is not just a car; it's a
statement, an extension of your persona that reflects your
uncompromising standards and zest for life. Don't let this
opportunity pass you by. Embrace the chance to own a
vehicle that will not only meet your expectations but exceed
them in every way imaginable. Your adventure awaits, and it
begins with the turn of a key in the ignition of this magnificent
Lexus GX 460. FOR MORE INFORMATION PLEASE TEXT
ME AT (972)522-9856 IVAN FERNANDEZ

2021 Lexus GX 460 Base

 

Hands-free Communication, Cruise Control, Lane Keep
Assist, Forward Collision Alert, Navigation, Back-up Camera,
Climate Control, Satellite Radio, Bluetooth, Powered Seats,

Heated Seats, Blind Spot Monitoring, Memory Seats,
Powered Windows/Locks, and many more! 

 

***

 

Come see our indoor showroom in Dallas with 100+ carefully
selected luxury vehicles from Volkswagen, Audi, and more!

We also have a service department, which offers expert
service on VW & Audi vehicles.

We Are Your DFW Premier Used & Pre Owned Dealer Near
Dallas, Plano, Frisco, McKinney, Addison, Richardson, Irving,

Grand Prairie, Arlington, and other surrounding cities.

We offer financing for any type of credit and first time buyers.
We take trade-ins, and offer world-wide shipping, extended
warranties, and installation of additional desired items. We

welcome third party inspections!
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Installed Options

Interior

- Air filtration - Front air conditioning: automatic climate control  

- Front air conditioning zones: dual  - Rear vents: second row 

- Center console trim: leatherette - Dash trim: leatherette - Door trim: leatherette 

- Floor mat material: carpet - Floor mats: front - Interior accents: wood 

- Steering wheel trim: leatherette - Adaptive cruise control  - Cargo area light 

- Conversation mirror - Footwell lights - Memorized settings: 2 driver 

- Power outlet(s): 115V cargo area  - Power steering: variable/speed-proportional 

- Push-button start - Rearview mirror: auto-dimming - Remote engine start 

- Steering wheel: power tilt and telescopic  

- Universal remote transmitter: Homelink - garage door opener  - Clock - Digital odometer 

- External temperature display - Multi-function display - Trip odometer 

- Driver seat power adjustments: 10  - Front seat type: bucket  

- Passenger seat power adjustments: 10  - Rear seat folding 

- Rear seat type: 40-20-40 split bench  - Third row seat folding: flat  

- Third row seat type: 50-50 split bench  - Upholstery: leatherette

Exterior

- Door handle color: chrome - Front bumper color: body-color - Mirror color: body-color 

- Mudguards: front - Rear spoiler: roofline - Running boards: illuminated 

- Daytime running lights: LED - Exterior entry lights: approach lamps  - Taillights: LED 

- Side mirrors: driver side auto-dimming - Roof rails: silver  - Spare wheel type: alloy  

- Tire Pressure Monitoring System - Wheels: aluminum alloy 

- Front wipers: variable intermittent - Laminated glass: acoustic 

- Liftgate window: manual flip-up - Power windows: safety reverse  - Rear privacy glass 

- Rear wiper: intermittent - Solar-tinted glass: front - Window defogger: rear
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