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Our Price $18,995
Specifications:

Year:  2014  

VIN:  1FTFW1ET0EFA32985  

Make:  Ford  

Stock:  24052  

Model/Trim:  F-150 XLT  

Condition:  Pre-Owned  

Body:  Pickup Truck  

Exterior:  Red  

Engine:  EcoBoost 3.5L Twin Turbo V6 365hp
420ft. lbs.

 

Interior:  -  

Transmission:  6-Speed Automatic  

Mileage:  135,741  

Drivetrain:  4 Wheel Drive  

Economy:  City 15 / Highway 21

Step into the world of uncompromising strength and undeniable allure
with this radiant red 2014 Ford F-150 XLT, a testament to the legacy of
America's best-selling trucks. With 135,741 miles of experience on the
open road, this F-150 is primed and ready to write new adventures with
you behind the wheel.

Let's talk about power – under the hood lies the heart of this beast, an
EcoBoost 3.5L Twin Turbo V6 engine that roars to life with 365
horsepower and a commanding 420 ft. lbs. of torque. This powerhouse
is coupled with a smooth-shifting 6-Speed Automatic transmission,
ensuring that you have the responsive performance and towing
capability you need, whether you're navigating busy city streets or
hauling your boat to the lake for a weekend getaway.

The exterior of this F-150 XLT gleams in a vibrant shade of red, a color
that not only turns heads but also speaks volumes about the driver's
confidence and passion. It's a truck that looks just as good pulling up to
a job site as it does taking your family out on the town.

Step inside, and you'll find a cabin that marries comfort with
functionality. The manufacturer options and packages have been
meticulously selected to enhance your driving experience, ensuring that
every journey is as enjoyable as the last.

But don't just take our word for it – this 2014 Ford F-150 XLT comes
with a pedigree of excellence, proven by its impressive array of awards.
It's been recognized by Edmunds as one of the Top 10 Best-Selling
Vehicles and one of the Top 10 Least Expensive Trucks, underlining its
value and popularity. J.D. Power and Associates have lavished this
model with praise, awarding it top marks in their Automotive

https://bleskinmotors.com/
tel:406-771-4691
https://bleskinmotors.com/vehicle/7286972/2014-ford-f-150-xlt-great-falls-montana-59405/7286972/ebrochure


 

model with praise, awarding it top marks in their Automotive
Performance, Execution and Layout (APEAL) Study, Initial Quality
Study (IQS), and Vehicle Dependability Study (VDS), highlighting its
exceptional performance, quality, and reliability. And let's not forget the
Kelley Blue Book's Brand Image Awards, where it was crowned as the
Best Overall Truck Brand, solidifying its status as an icon in the
automotive world.

Owning this 2014 Ford F-150 XLT isn't just about having a vehicle; it's
about embracing a lifestyle. It's for the doers, the builders, the dreamers
– those who demand excellence and refuse to settle for anything less.
Whether you're towing, hauling, or simply cruising, this F-150 is a
companion that won't let you down.

Imagine the envious glances as you roll by, the feeling of power at your
fingertips, and the sense of achievement that comes with owning a
vehicle of such caliber. Don't miss your chance to claim this piece of
American engineering excellence.

Come, take the wheel of this 2014 Ford F-150 XLT, and experience the
blend of performance, dependability, and style that can only come from
a truck of this stature. Your new chapter awaits – all roads lead to
adventure, and the key to your next journey is here, ready to ignite.
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Vehicle History Report : as Of 04/27/2024

*carfax Snapshot is a reflection of available information on the date the report was pulled. carfax
is constantly being updated with new information and is subject to change at any time.

 

Our Location :

Snapshot

2014 FORD F-150 XLT

Accident reported

28 Service history
records

3 Previous owners

Types of owners: Lease,
Personal

Last owned in Montana

135,741 Last reported odometer
reading

FREE CARFAX Report

See the full CARFAX Report for additional information

https://bleskinmotors.com/vehicle/7286972/2014-ford-f-150-xlt-great-falls-montana-59405/7286972/ebrochure
https://www.carfax.com/VehicleHistory/p/Report.cfx?partner=AVR_0&vin=1FTFW1ET0EFA32985&source=BUP
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Installed Options

Interior

- Front air conditioning  - Floor mat material: carpet - Floor mats: front - Ashtray 

- Capless fuel filler system - Cruise control - Keypad entry  - Lighter element 

- Multi-function remote: keyless entry - Power outlet(s): 12V front  - Power steering - Clock 

- Compass - External temperature display - Driver seat manual adjustments 

- Front seat type: 40-20-40 split bench  - Passenger seat manual adjustments 

- Rear seat folding: folds up  - Rear seat type: 60-40 split bench  - Upholstery: cloth

Exterior

- Front bumper color: chrome - Pickup bed light - Front fog lights  

- Side mirror adjustments: power - Spare wheel type: steel  

- Tire Pressure Monitoring System - Wheels: aluminum alloy with painted accents  

- Power windows - Rear privacy glass - Tinted glass
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