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Our Price $20,995
Specifications:

Year:  2015  

VIN:  1GNSKBKC2FR197285  

Make:  Chevrolet  

Model/Trim:  Tahoe LT  

Condition:  Pre-Owned  

Body:  SUV  

Exterior:  [G1C] Slate Gray Metallic  

Engine:  EcoTec3 5.3L Flex Fuel V8 355hp 383ft.
lbs.

 

Interior:  Gray Leather  

Transmission:  6-Speed Shiftable Automatic w/Overdrive  

Mileage:  108,154  

Drivetrain:  4 Wheel Drive  

Economy:  City 11 / Highway 16

LEATHER!!MOONROOF!!QUAD SEATING!!THIRD ROW
SEATING!!NAVIGATION!!CALL 651-460-6655

Check out our full line of inventory at DAKOTAMOTOR.COM

Call us anytime and ask for Bart or David and we will be happy to assist
you. For your convenience please call before you come to be certain of
availability.  Full financing available. All of our vehicles have been
checked by our in house service department. All of our vehicles are
clean title and have actual miles. Enjoy our low overhead low price
philosophy. We buy in bulk and sell at wholesale cost to save you the
new car store markup!! 30years in wholesaling makes us retailing’s
smartest choice for a price savvy saver.

Step into the realm of refined power and unmatched versatility with this
stunning 2015 Chevrolet Tahoe LT. Coated in a sophisticated gray
exterior that exudes class, this full-size SUV is a true testament to
Chevrolet's commitment to excellence, boasting a mere 108,154 miles
on the odometer. It's not just a vehicle; it's a statement of style and
reliability that will serve you and your family on countless adventures.

The heartbeat of this majestic beast is the robust EcoTec3 5.3L Flex
Fuel V8 engine, delivering a commanding 355 horsepower and 383
foot-pounds of torque. Paired with a silky-smooth 6-Speed Shiftable
Automatic transmission with Overdrive, this Tahoe LT promises to
provide an exhilarating yet comfortable driving experience, whether
cruising down the highway or navigating through city streets.

Slide into the cabin and be greeted by the luxurious gray leather interior
that offers a harmonious blend of comfort and elegance. The
meticulously crafted seats provide the perfect balance of support and
relaxation, ensuring every journey is a pleasure, no matter the distance.
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relaxation, ensuring every journey is a pleasure, no matter the distance.
This Tahoe's interior isn't just about comfort; it's a sanctuary that you
and your passengers will appreciate on every trip.

As a testament to its enduring value and performance, this 2015
Chevrolet Tahoe LT has been showered with accolades, including an
honorable mention for Edmunds's Best Retained Value and being
named as one of the top models in J.D. Power and Associates's
Automotive Performance, Execution, and Layout (APEAL) Study. Its
commitment to initial quality hasn't gone unnoticed, as it's been ranked
highest in J.D. Power and Associates's Initial Quality Study (IQS).
Moreover, the Tahoe's dependability shines through, with recognition as
one of the top models in J.D. Power and Associates's Vehicle
Dependability Study (VDS).

The praise doesn't stop there; Kelley Blue Book has honored this model
as the Best Buy in the Full-Size SUV category, one of the Best Family
Cars, and awarded it for the Best Resale Value among Full-Size
SUVs/Crossovers. These awards are a testament to the Tahoe's ability
to deliver lasting value and satisfaction to its proud owners.

Imagine the possibilities as you take the helm of this 2015 Chevrolet
Tahoe LT. Whether it's accommodating the whole family on a weekend
getaway, towing your boat to the lake, or simply enjoying the prestige
and comfort it brings to your daily commute, this Tahoe is ready for
whatever life throws your way.

Don't miss the opportunity to own this award-winning, meticulously
engineered SUV that combines luxury, performance, and dependability
in one irresistible package. The 2015 Chevrolet Tahoe LT is more than
just a vehicle; it's a trusted companion that's ready to embark on life's
journeys with you. Contact us today to schedule a test drive and
experience firsthand why this Tahoe isn't just a choice—it's the only
choice for discerning drivers seeking excellence on the road.
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Installed Options

Interior

- Front air conditioning: automatic climate control  - Front air conditioning zones: dual  

- Rear air conditioning: automatic climate control  - Floor mat material: carpet 

- Floor mats: front - Steering wheel trim: leather - Adjustable pedals: power 

- Cargo area light - Cruise control - Memorized settings: adjustable pedals 

- Multi-function remote: keyless entry - Power outlet(s): 115V - Power steering 

- Rearview mirror: auto-dimming - Steering wheel: tilt and telescopic  

- Universal remote transmitter: garage door opener  - Clock - Digital odometer 

- External temperature display - Multi-function display - Trip odometer - Driver seat: heated  

- Driver seat power adjustments: 10  - Front seat type: bucket  - Passenger seat: heated  

- Passenger seat power adjustments: 10  - Rear seat folding: split  

- Rear seat type: 60-40 split bench  - Third row seat folding: flat  

- Third row seat type: 40-60 split bench  - Upholstery: leather-trimmed

Exterior

- Front bumper color: body-color - Mirror color: body-color - Running boards 

- Daytime running lights  - Side mirrors: heated  - Roof rails: black  - Spare wheel type: steel  

- Tire Pressure Monitoring System - Wheels: aluminum alloy - Front wipers: rain sensing  

- Power windows - Rear wiper: intermittent - Solar-tinted glass - Window defogger: rear
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