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Sales Price $19,990
List Price $21,995

Specifications:

Year:  2020  

VIN:  JN1BJ1CV4LW264572  

Make:  Nissan  

Stock:  264572  

Model/Trim:  Rogue Sport S  

Condition:  Pre-Owned  

Body:  Wagon  

Exterior:  Gun Metallic  

Engine:  2.0L I4 141hp 147ft. lbs.  

Interior:  Charcoal  

Transmission:  7-Speed Shiftable CVT  

Mileage:  46,627  

Drivetrain:  Front Wheel Drive

Step into the world of dynamic driving and refined comfort with the 2020
Nissan Rogue Sport S, a compact SUV that's designed to elevate your
daily commute and weekend adventures alike. This sleek and stylish
vehicle is not just a mode of transportation; it's your passport to a life of
exhilaration and reliability.

Under the hood of this captivating Rogue Sport S lies a robust 2.0L I4
engine, producing a hearty 141 horsepower and 147 ft. lbs. of torque.
This powertrain offers the perfect balance of energy and efficiency,
ensuring a spirited drive that's also kind to your wallet. Whether you're
navigating city streets or cruising on the highway, the engine's
responsive nature and the smoothness of the 7-Speed Shiftable CVT
(Continuously Variable Transmission) create a driving experience that's
both engaging and serene.

The 7-Speed Shiftable CVT is a marvel of modern engineering,
delivering seamless acceleration and the ability to manually shift gears
without a traditional clutch. This transmission is designed to keep the
engine in its optimal power range, enhancing performance while also
maximizing fuel efficiency. You'll enjoy the ease of an automatic with
the feel of a manual, giving you the best of both worlds.

Step inside the 2020 Nissan Rogue Sport S and you'll be greeted by a
cabin that's both comfortable and functional. The manufacturer options
and packages available on this model have been meticulously selected
to enhance your driving experience. Every detail, from the intuitive
controls to the premium materials, has been designed with the driver in
mind. The spacious interior offers ample room for passengers and
cargo, making it the ideal companion for road trips, errands, and
everything in between.
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Safety is paramount in the Nissan Rogue Sport S, and you can drive
with confidence knowing that this vehicle is equipped with the latest
safety features and technologies. The advanced airbag system, anti-
lock brakes, and stability control work in harmony to protect you and
your loved ones. You'll have peace of mind knowing that the Rogue
Sport S is not only fun to drive but also prioritizes your safety.

The exterior of the 2020 Nissan Rogue Sport S is a testament to
Nissan's commitment to design excellence. The bold lines and
aerodynamic shape not only look great but also contribute to the
vehicle's impressive performance. The eye-catching design is sure to
turn heads, while the practical features like the power-adjustable
mirrors and automatic headlights add convenience to your daily routine.

In summary, the 2020 Nissan Rogue Sport S is a vehicle that doesn't
compromise. It offers the perfect blend of power, efficiency, comfort,
and style. With its impressive engine, innovative transmission, and
thoughtful features, this compact SUV stands out as a leader in its
class. Don't just take our word for it—come experience the thrill of the
Rogue Sport S for yourself. It's more than just a vehicle; it's a
statement. Make it yours today and embark on a journey that promises
to be as rewarding as it is exciting.
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Installed Options

Interior

- Air filtration - Front air conditioning  - Rear vents: second row - Cargo area light 

- Cargo cover: hard - Cruise control - Multi-function remote: keyless entry 

- Power outlet(s): two 12V front  - Power steering: variable/speed-proportional 

- Steering wheel: tilt and telescopic  - Tool kit - Clock - Digital odometer 

- External temperature display - Multi-function display - Trip odometer 

- Front seat type: bucket  - Rear seat folding: split  - Rear seat type: 60-40 split bench  

- Upholstery: cloth

Exterior

- Front bumper color: body-color - Grille color: black with chrome accents  

- Mirror color: body-color - Rear spoiler: roofline - Daytime running lights: LED 

- Exterior entry lights: approach lamps  - Taillights: LED - Spare wheel type: steel  

- Tire Pressure Monitoring System - Wheels: steel - Front wipers: variable intermittent 

- Power windows: safety reverse  - Rear privacy glass - Rear wiper: intermittent 

- Solar-tinted glass: front - Window defogger: rear

All prices listed are CASH Discounted Prices plus tax, title, license and fees.
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