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Our Price $195,000
Specifications:

Year:  2018  

VIN:  WD3FE7CD7JP593037  

Make:  Mercedes-Benz  

Model/Trim:  Sprinter Cargo Van Winnebago Revel 44E  

Condition:  Pre-Owned  

Body:  Minivan/Van  

Exterior:  Jet Black  

Engine:  Engine: 3.0L V6 Turbo Diesel  

Interior:  Gray  

Mileage:  36,300  

Drivetrain:  4 Wheel Drive

QUESTIONS? CALL US AT 561-318-
3980

www.floridacarquest.com

You are viewing a near perfect Florida
Pristine 2019 Winnebago Revel 4WD
RV. It is finished with a Black Exterior
with 20" Black Rhino Arsenal Installed
Aluminum Alloy Wheels. They are
fitted with a decent set of 35” High
Performance Off/On Road Steel Belted
Radial Tires. RENNTECH Acceleration
Tune. Pedal Box for city and off road
The Interior is Grey Leather Stitched
Rear Matching Garage Day Bed
System. The Headliner storage
system. Revel is built on a Mercedes
2500 4x4 Diesel Chassis. This Revel
44E has never been taken off road but
is ready to go. With the ROAMRIG
upgraded electrical system the RV
cabin can run off solar ands battery for
days without Shore Line plugin.

The mileage is low at 36,000.

Our 2019 Winnebago Revel 44E was

https://thepalmbeachcollection.com/
tel:561-318-3980
file:///7075057/ebrochure


 

Our 2019 Winnebago Revel 44E was
built in a 2018 chassis in 2019.

Our 2019 Winnebago Revel has a long
list of creature comforts including
Automatic 6-Speed Transmission,
Panasonic AM/FM/Sirius Satellite
Radio Premium Sound System, Rear
Seat Video Entertainment System,
Books & Manuals, Power Glass
Sunroof, Power Door Locks,
Illuminated " Mercedes Benz" Entry,
Remote Keyless Entry, Inflatable
Lumbar Seat, Park Assist, Rear Back
Up Camera, Dual Lighted Vanity
Mirrors, 3rd. Row Seating, Cruise
Control, Front & Side Air Bags, 20"
Black Rhino Arsenal Installed
Aluminum Alloy Rims with 35” Off
Road Tires, USB Port, Bluetooth
Hands Free Phone, Multi-Function
Steering Wheel, Step Up Rails, Roof
Luggage Racks, 4 Wheel Drive, This
one of a kind Revel 44E has all
modifications a traveler could want.
ROAMRIGS Revel power system
stage 2, VAN COMPASS stage 6.5 2”
Lift with Falcon shocks built for high
speed off roading, Skid Plates to
protect under engine-transmission-gas
tank-differential all powder coated red,
VS30 Air Up system under
hood,Floating Lights, ALUMINESS
Front Bumper, LIGHT FORCE hybrid
lights, FREEDOM VAN GO Roof
Rack,170 watt 9.4amp solar panels,
RIPPLE WEAR privacy panels and
curtains, DOMETIC 200 9500 Awning,
CANYON ADVENTURE VANS GLSS
Lounge Day Bed, Console tables, Bike
Mount System,Folding Step. Bed
Risors, LUXE Cool Gel Memory Foam
Matress, Dream Sheets, OWL VANS
Ladder and Tire carrier, Expedition
Handle, B2 CARRIER /BIKE and BOX,
BACKWOODS box, TRIGGER
SHOOTER, RENNTECH TUNE,
PEDAL BOX, RHINO LINING and
many other modifications. In total



 

many other modifications. In total
about 70,000.00 worth of extra for
comfort and off roading.

I've been doing this online for nearly
25-years. This one is a creampuff.
Money back guarantee if it's not near
perfect in any way. You will not find a
cleaner one anywhere.

We are offering our 2019 Winnebago
Revel 44E with a Buy It Now or Best
Offer Format. We cheerfully accept all
fair offers on any of the fine
automobiles we have in our inventory.
Call us at 561-318-3980 with your
questions & offers.

 

Revel

With the Winnebago® 4x4 Revel™ –
built on the Mercedes-Benz® Sprinter
chassis – it’s time that RVers start
treating roads more like suggestions.
The function-fueled design, powered
by the reliability of a 3-liter turbo diesel
engine and the freedom of on-demand
4WD means going off-road is never off
the table.
 

Weights & Measurements

Exterior Length
19'7"
Exterior Height
10'
Exterior Width
7'1"
Awning Length
9'6"
Interior Height
6'3"
Interior Width
5'9.75"
Freshwater Tank Capacity (gal.)
21
Water Heater Capacity (gal.)
Continuous
Holding Tank Capacity — Gray (gal.)



 

Holding Tank Capacity — Gray (gal.)
21
Fuel Capacity (gal.)
24.5
GCWR (lbs.)
13,550
GVWR (lbs.)
9050
GAWR - Front (lbs.)
4,101
GAWR - Rear (lbs.)
5,360
Wheelbase
144"
Cassette Toilet Capacity (gal.)
5
Sleeps
2
 

Chassis

Mercedes-Benz® Sprinter Chassis
3.0L 6-cylinder, 188-hp, turbo-diesel
engine, 7G-Tronic automatic
transmission, 220-amp. alternator
On-demand 4WD w/Hi/Lo range,
electronic stability, and traction control
4-wheel ABS brakes
Trailer Hitch6 5,000-lb. drawbar/500-lb.
maximum vertical tongue weight
7-pin wiring connector
 

Cab Conveniences

Panasonic touchscreen multimedia
infotainment center w/navigation, Wi-Fi
hotspot, intelligent voice control and
rear camera
Cab seats armrests, adjustable lumbar
support, adjustable headrest, and
slide/swivel/recline
3-point seat belts
Dual airbags
DISTRONIC PLUS® (adaptive cruise
control)
Power steering w/tilt wheel
Power mirrors w/defrost and turn
signals



 

signals
Power door locks w/remote
Power windows
12-volt powerpoints
Sunvisors
Folding privacy screens for cab door
windows
Appliqué package
Keyless entry w/remote
Entry door assist handle
w/Ram® Tough-Track™ mount
Rain sensor w/integrated wet wiper
system
High beam assist
Active brake assist
Active lane keeping assist
Blind spot assist
Traffic sign assist
Dash charging station

Interior

LED ceiling lights w/dimmer switch
Tinted dual-pane euro acrylic windows
w/cassette shades
Deluxe powered ventilator fan w/rain
cover
Systems monitor panel
USB charging points
RAM® Tough-Track™ mounts
throughout
Heavy-duty vinyl flooring throughout

Galley

Removable counter extension
Laminate countertop
Portable single burner induction range
top
3.0 cu. ft. (12V) compressor driven
refrigerator/freezer
Stainless steel sink w/single control
faucet
Pantry
Removable, pedestal dinette table
Full-extension drawers

Bath

Shower w/wall surround
Flexible showerhead



 

Flexible showerhead
Shower curtain
Wet Bath 31"x26"
2 removable shelves convert to wet
storage cabinet
Removable clothes rod
Swiveling cassette toilet
Powered roof vent

Bedroom

Power Lift Bed w/molded pockets and
zip storage below
Under-bed gear garage storage w/six
removable cargo tie-down anchors
Powered roof vent (NA w/air
conditioner)
Reading lights

Electrical System

AC/DC load center/converter
(2) 125-amp-hour Lithium ion batteries
w/dedicated second alternator to
charge system
Coach battery disconnect system
Dual-battery charge system
30-amp. power cord
Solar panel/battery charger
2,000-watt inverter/charger
Roof port wiring access

Plumbing System

Water center control panel includes all
control valves, connection points and
exterior wash station w/pump switch
Winterization Package with valve and
siphon tube
On-demand water pump
Galley drain pump
Heated gray water holding tank
Potable water tank

Safety

Smoke and carbon monoxide detectors
Fire extinguisher
Ground fault interrupter
Daytime running lamps
High-mount brake lamps



 

                                                 
 

ROAMRIG REVEL POWER SYSTEM
STAGE 2.           14,000.00
CAVANS CONSOLE TABLE.               
                              350.00
CAVANS BIKE MNT SYSTEM              
                            225.00
CAVANS FOLDING BED STEP.          
                              200.00
PRIVACY PANELS.                               
                            250.00
REVEL DREAM SHEETS “NEW”.       
                            400.00
LUXE COOL GEL MEMORY FOAM
MATTRESS.         1,400.00
VENT COVER.                                      
                            115.00
PRIVACY CURTAINS                          
                              700.00
VAN COMPASS STAGE 6.5 2”LIFT     
                          5,825.00
CARGO TRAY SLIDE OUT                 
                              700.00
CAVANS GLSS LOUNGE AND DAY
BED                       3645.00
REAR WINDOW COVERS.                 
                              350.00

CAVANS BED RISERS.                       
                          1,200.00
BLACK RHINO ARSENAL WHEELS    
                        1,250.00
OWLV EXPEDITION HANDLE/ TIRE
CARRIER.             235.00
VANCOMPASS ENGINE SKID
PLATE.                            750.00
TRANSMISSION SKID PLATE.           
                            525.00
DIFFERENTIAL SKID PLATE.             
                            350.00
FUEL TANK SKID PLATE.                   
                            800.00
PEDAL BOX ACCELERATION
OPTIMIZER.                   300.00
RENN TECH ENGINE TUNE.               
                        1,475.00
WARN ZEON 12-S PLATINUM



 

WARN ZEON 12-S PLATINUM
WINCH.                       2,130.00
VAN COMPASS VS30 UNDER HOOD
AIR.                      700.00
VAN COMPASS FLOATING LIGHT    
                            1,500.00
VELCRO VISOR.                                  
                              35.00
FIRE EXTINGUISHER MOLLE.           
                              35.00
MOLLE SEAT BACK PANEL X 2.        
                            120.00
HEADREST VELCRO PANEL             
                              80.00
OWLVAN LADDER+TIRE CARRIER   
                        1,715.00
B2 CARRIER / BIKE +BOX                   
                      1,715.00
SMALL POUCH.                                   
                            30.00
CUTTING BOARD SINK TOP.             
                          160.00
WEATHER TECH FLOOR MATS.        
                            65.00
RIPPLE WEAR REAR DOOR
PRIVACY                         230.00
RIPPLE WEAR CURTAIN PACKAGE
WINDSHIELD     500.00  
REAR MOLLE PANELS                       
                          900.00
CURTAIN FOR SLIDING DOOR.         
                          210.00
1UP BIKE TRAYS X 2.                         
                          590.00
HEADLINER.VAN LIFE                        
                          600.00
DOMETIC 200 9500 AWNING .           
                        1,400.00 
BACKWOODS CABINET BOX.           
                          715.00
ROOF RACK PANELS                         
                          300.00
FREEDOM VAN GO ROOF RACK      
                        3,200.00
170 WATT 9.4AMP SOLAR.                 
                        1,000.00
DIODE DYNAMITIC WHITE LIGHT.  
50”                       500.00



 

50”                       500.00
DIODE STAGE SERIES 3                     
                          300.00
LIGHT FORCE HYBRID DR LIGHTS.  
                        1,300.00
MTN BRACKETS.                                 
                          300.00
TRIGGER SHOOTER.                          
                          950.00
AIR UP KIT.                                          
                            40.00
REVEL LINI MOUNT                            
                          310.00
ALUMINESS FRONT BUMPER           
                        3,000.00
3X ROTO PAX                                      
                          200.00
KINETIC ROPES.                                 
                          165.00
RECOVERY TOW STRAP BAG.          
                            65.00
TIRE STORAGE BAG.                          
                          200.00
FARMBOY  TIRES /INSTALLS / SKID/
SUSPEN.       4100.00
RHINO LINING                                     
                        7000.00
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Installed Options

Interior

- Driver Foot Rest - Engine Immobilizer - FOB Controls -inc: Cargo Access 

- Fade-To-Off Interior Lighting - Front Cigar Lighter(s) - Front Cloth Headliner 

- Front Cupholder - Front Only Vinyl/Rubber Floor Covering 

- Full Overhead Console w/Storage and 2 12V DC Power Outlets  

- Gauges -inc: Speedometer, Odometer, Tachometer and Trip Odometer  

- HVAC -inc: Residual Heat Recirculation and Supplemental Heater  

- Instrument Panel Bin, Dashboard Storage, Interior Concealed Storage, Driver And
Passenger Door Bins

- Locking Glove Box - Manual Adjustable Front Head Restraints - Manual Air Conditioning 

- Manual Tilt/Telescoping Steering Column - Outside Temp Gauge 

- Power 1st Row Windows w/Driver And Passenger 1-Touch Down  - Power Door Locks 

- Remote Keyless Entry w/Integrated Key Transmitter and Illuminated Entry  

- Seats w/Vinyl Back Material  - Tunja Seat Upholstery  - Urethane Gear Shifter Material  

- 2 12V DC Power Outlets  

- 4-Way Driver Seat -inc: Manual Recline and Fore/Aft Movement  - 4-Way Passenger Seat  

- Air Filtration - Analog Appearance - Ashtray - Board Floor Trim 

- Bucket Seats -inc: adjustable front passenger seat  - Cargo Space Lights  

- Day-Night Rearview Mirror - Driver And Front Passenger Armrests

Exterior

- Splash Guards - Split Swing-Out Rear Cargo Access - Steel Spare Wheel 

- Tailgate/Rear Door Lock Included w/Power Door Locks  - Tires: All-Season 

- Tires: Continental - Tires: LT245/75R16 - Wheels w/Silver Accents w/Hub Covers 

- Wheels: 6.5J x 16" Steel  - Sliding Rear Passenger Side Door  - Light Tinted Glass 

- LED Brakelights - Fully Galvanized Steel Panels 

- Full-Size Spare Tire Stored Underbody w/Crankdown - Front License Plate Bracket 

- Fixed Interval Wipers - Driver & Passenger Door-Mounted Assist Handles  

- Clearcoat Paint w/Badging - Black Side Windows Trim and Black Front Windshield Trim  

- Black Manual Side Mirrors w/Convex Spotter and Manual Folding  - Black Grille 

- Black Door Handles - Argent Rear Bumper w/1 Tow Hook  

- Argent Front Bumper w/2 Tow Hooks  - Argent Bodyside Moldings 

- Aero-Composite Halogen Daytime Running Headlamps

Safety

- Driver Foot Rest - Engine Immobilizer - FOB Controls -inc: Cargo Access 

- Fade-To-Off Interior Lighting - Front Cigar Lighter(s) - Front Cloth Headliner 

- Front Cupholder - Front Only Vinyl/Rubber Floor Covering 

- Full Overhead Console w/Storage and 2 12V DC Power Outlets  

- Gauges -inc: Speedometer, Odometer, Tachometer and Trip Odometer  

- HVAC -inc: Residual Heat Recirculation and Supplemental Heater  

file:///7075057/ebrochure


- HVAC -inc: Residual Heat Recirculation and Supplemental Heater  

- Instrument Panel Bin, Dashboard Storage, Interior Concealed Storage, Driver And
Passenger Door Bins

- Locking Glove Box - Manual Adjustable Front Head Restraints - Manual Air Conditioning 

- Manual Tilt/Telescoping Steering Column - Outside Temp Gauge 

- Power 1st Row Windows w/Driver And Passenger 1-Touch Down  - Power Door Locks 

- Remote Keyless Entry w/Integrated Key Transmitter and Illuminated Entry  

- Seats w/Vinyl Back Material  - Tunja Seat Upholstery  - Urethane Gear Shifter Material  

- 2 12V DC Power Outlets  

- 4-Way Driver Seat -inc: Manual Recline and Fore/Aft Movement  - 4-Way Passenger Seat  

- Air Filtration - Analog Appearance - Ashtray - Board Floor Trim 

- Bucket Seats -inc: adjustable front passenger seat  - Cargo Space Lights  

- Day-Night Rearview Mirror - Driver And Front Passenger Armrests

Mechanical

- 12V/100 Amp Battery - 14 V/220A Alternator  - 24.5 Gal. Fuel Tank  

- 3215# Maximum Payload 

- 4-Wheel Disc Brakes w/4-Wheel ABS, Front Vented Discs, Brake Assist and Hill Hold
Control

- 4x4 High Range Transfer Case w/Low Gear  - 850CCA Maintenance-Free Battery 

- Auto Locking Hubs  - Axle Ratio: 3.92 - Engine: 3.0L V6 Turbo Diesel  

- Front And Rear HD Anti-Roll Bars - GVWR: 8,550 lbs - HD Shock Absorbers  

- Hydraulic Power-Assist Steering - Leaf Rear Suspension w/Leaf Springs  

- Single Stainless Steel Exhaust  - Strut Front Suspension w/Transverse Leaf Springs  

- Transmission w/Sequential Shift Control w/Steering Wheel Controls and Oil Cooler  

- Transmission: 5-Speed Automatic

Option Packages

Factory Installed
Packages

 

 

 

 

$85

-  

12V DRIVER SEAT BASE POWER
OUTLET

$85

-  

12V REAR COMPARTMENT POWER
OUTLET

$112

-  

2 ADDITIONAL MASTER KEYS

$33

-  
3-BUTTON KEYS

$385

-  

ADDITIONAL BATTERY PACKAGE
-inc: Additional Battery Cutoff

Relay, Retrofit Additional
Battery

$431

-  

ADDITIONAL BRACKET FOR AUXILIARY
ALTERNATOR

$3,820

-  

HIGH PERFORMANCE AIR
CONDITIONING PACKAGE

$2,525

-  
HIGH ROOF

$1,445

-  

PREMIUM APPEARANCE PACKAGE
-inc: Headlamp Washing System,

Wheels: 6.5J x 16" Light Alloy,
Bi-Xenon Headlamps

$277

-  

ROOF RACK MOUNTING RAILS

$2,240

-  

WINDOW FLEET PACKAGE
-inc: Rear Laminated Glass, Panel

Van w/Windows All Round,
Rear Window Defroster,

Passenger Side 2nd Row



If you are financing the vehicle, please have it pre-approved before bidding. We can help locate possible financing options.<br /> <br /> Once you bid you are entering a legal and

binding contract to purchase the vehicle described. There are no bid retractions accepted within the final 24 hours of the auction.<br /> <br /> We will not accept shill-bidding,

bidders with excessive negative feedbacks, or unqualified bidders.<br /> <br /> Cars Cars Cars DBA &quot;The Palm Beach Collection&quot; reserves the right to cancel our

auctions early for any reason at any time.<br /> <br /> Please make sure all your questions are answered before bidding.<br /> <br /> If you are unsure about the color of a vehicle,

please use the VIN and call your local dealer for more specifics.<br /> <br /> We accept money orders, cashiers checks, or wire transfers as forms of payment. We reserve the right

to hold the title until cashiers checks clear our bank (5 to 7 days). We do not exchange a check for a title.<br /> <br /> If the vehicle is to be registered in the state of Florida the buyer

must add all applicable sales tax and licensing fees to the final auction price. Out of state buyers who wish to pick up the vehicle and drive it home may have to pay their states sales

tax through the state of Florida. Call us for details.<br /> <br /> We require a $500 non refundable deposit within 48 hours of the auction ending. If the buyer cannot pay the balance

in full within 7-days we can make special &quot;Delayed Payment Arrangements.&quot; Delayed Payment Arrangements MUST be requested &amp; approved by seller prior to

bidding.<br /> <br /> The buyer is responsible for shipping arrangements and costs. Occasionally we can help arrange shipping.<br /> <br /> Some of the automobiles we offer are

still under Manufacturers Warranty Factory Warranty. In all other cases cars are sold &quot;AS/IS&quot; unless otherwise noted.<br /> <br /> We do not accept escrow services. The

vehicle must be paid in full before leaving our business. Buyer will be provided a temporary license plate that gives the buyer 21 days to register the vehicle. We reserve the right of

the full 21 days to provide you with a title. We do not send titles to the buyer until paperwork is signed and in our possession.<br /> <br /> We are not responsible for mistakes in the

ad. We are only human and occasionally make an unintentional mistake. Please call or email to have any and all questions about the vehicle you are bidding on answered before

you commit to purchasing.<br /> <br /> All vehicles are sold in accordance with the laws of Florida in the jurisdiction of Palm Beach County.<br /> ANY QUESTIONS PLEASE CALL

561-318-3980<br /> <br /> If you are financing the vehicle, please have it pre-approved before bidding. We can help locate possible financing options.<br /> <br /> Once you bid you

are entering a legal and binding contract to purchase the vehicle described. There are no bid retractions accepted within the final 24 hours of the auction.<br /> <br /> We will not

accept shill-bidding, bidders with excessive negative feedbacks, or unqualified bidders.<br /> <br /> Cars Cars Cars DBA &quot;The Palm Beach Collection&quot; reserves the right

to cancel our auctions early for any reason at any time.<br /> <br /> Please make sure all your questions are answered before bidding.<br /> <br /> If you are unsure about the color

of a vehicle, please use the VIN and call your local dealer for more specifics.<br /> <br /> We accept money orders, cashiers checks, or wire transfers as forms of payment. We

reserve the right to hold the title until cashiers checks clear our bank (5 to 7 days). We do not exchange a check for a title.<br /> <br /> If the vehicle is to be registered in the state of

Florida the buyer must add all applicable sales tax and licensing fees to the final auction price. Out of state buyers who wish to pick up the vehicle and drive it home may have to

pay their states sales tax through the state of Florida. Call us for details.<br /> <br /> We require a $500 non refundable deposit within 48 hours of the auction ending. If the buyer

cannot pay the balance in full within 7-days we can make special &quot;Delayed Payment Arrangements.&quot; Delayed Payment Arrangements MUST be requested &amp;

approved by seller prior to bidding.<br /> <br /> The buyer is responsible for shipping arrangements and costs. Occasionally we can help arrange shipping.<br /> <br /> Some of the

automobiles we offer are still under Manufacturers Warranty Factory Warranty. In all other cases cars are sold &quot;AS/IS&quot; unless otherwise noted.<br /> <br /> We do not

accept escrow services. The vehicle must be paid in full before leaving our business. Buyer will be provided a temporary license plate that gives the buyer 21 days to register the

vehicle. We reserve the right of the full 21 days to provide you with a title. We do not send titles to the buyer until paperwork is signed and in our possession.<br /> <br /> We are not

responsible for mistakes in the ad. We are only human and occasionally make an unintentional mistake. Please call or email to have any and all questions about the vehicle you are

bidding on answered before you commit to purchasing.<br /> <br /> All vehicles are sold in accordance with the laws of Florida in the jurisdiction of Palm Beach County.<br /> ANY

QUESTIONS PLEASE CALL 561-318-3980<br /> <br /> If you are financing the vehicle, please have it pre-approved before bidding. We can help locate possible financing options.

<br /> <br /> Once you bid you are entering a legal and binding contract to purchase the vehicle described. There are no bid retractions accepted within the final 24 hours of the

auction.<br /> <br /> We will not accept shill-bidding, bidders with excessive negative feedbacks, or unqualified bidders.<br /> <br /> Cars Cars Cars DBA &quot;The Palm Beach

Collection&quot; reserves the right to cancel our auctions early for any reason at any time.<br /> <br /> Please make sure all your questions are answered before bidding.<br /> <br

/> If you are unsure about the color of a vehicle, please use the VIN and call your local dealer for more specifics.<br /> <br /> We accept money orders, cashiers checks, or wire

transfers as forms of payment. We reserve the right to hold the title until cashiers checks clear our bank (5 to 7 days). We do not exchange a check for a title.<br /> <br /> If the

vehicle is to be registered in the state of Florida the buyer must add all applicable sales tax and licensing fees to the final auction price. Out of state buyers who wish to pick up the

vehicle and drive it home may have to pay their states sales tax through the state of Florida. Call us for details.<br /> <br /> We require a $500 non refundable deposit within 48 hours

of the auction ending. If the buyer cannot pay the balance in full within 7-days we can make special &quot;Delayed Payment Arrangements.&quot; Delayed Payment Arrangements

MUST be requested &amp; approved by seller prior to bidding.<br /> <br /> The buyer is responsible for shipping arrangements and costs. Occasionally we can help arrange

shipping.<br /> <br /> Some of the automobiles we offer are still under Manufacturers Warranty Factory Warranty. In all other cases cars are sold &quot;AS/IS&quot; unless

otherwise noted.<br /> <br /> We do not accept escrow services. The vehicle must be paid in full before leaving our business. Buyer will be provided a temporary license plate that

gives the buyer 21 days to register the vehicle. We reserve the right of the full 21 days to provide you with a title. We do not send titles to the buyer until paperwork is signed and in

our possession.<br /> <br /> We are not responsible for mistakes in the ad. We are only human and occasionally make an unintentional mistake. Please call or email to have any and

all questions about the vehicle you are bidding on answered before you commit to purchasing.<br /> <br /> All vehicles are sold in accordance with the laws of Florida in the

jurisdiction of Palm Beach County.<br /> ANY QUESTIONS PLEASE CALL 561-318-3980<br /> <br /> If you are financing the vehicle, please have it pre-approved before bidding.

We can help locate possible financing options.<br /> <br /> Once you bid you are entering a legal and binding contract to purchase the vehicle described. There are no bid

retractions accepted within the final 24 hours of the auction.<br /> <br /> We will not accept shill-bidding, bidders with excessive negative feedbacks, or unqualified bidders.<br />

<br /> Cars Cars Cars DBA &quot;The Palm Beach Collection&quot; reserves the right to cancel our auctions early for any reason at any time.<br /> <br /> Please make sure all your

questions are answered before bidding.<br /> <br /> If you are unsure about the color of a vehicle, please use the VIN and call your local dealer for more specifics.<br /> <br /> We

accept money orders, cashiers checks, or wire transfers as forms of payment. We reserve the right to hold the title until cashiers checks clear our bank (5 to 7 days). We do not

exchange a check for a title.<br /> <br /> If the vehicle is to be registered in the state of Florida the buyer must add all applicable sales tax and licensing fees to the final auction

price. Out of state buyers who wish to pick up the vehicle and drive it home may have to pay their states sales tax through the state of Florida. Call us for details.<br /> <br /> We

require a $500 non refundable deposit within 48 hours of the auction ending. If the buyer cannot pay the balance in full within 7-days we can make special &quot;Delayed Payment

Arrangements.&quot; Delayed Payment Arrangements MUST be requested &amp; approved by seller prior to bidding.<br /> <br /> The buyer is responsible for shipping

arrangements and costs. Occasionally we can help arrange shipping.<br /> <br /> Some of the automobiles we offer are still under Manufacturers Warranty Factory Warranty. In all

other cases cars are sold &quot;AS/IS&quot; unless otherwise noted.<br /> <br /> We do not accept escrow services. The vehicle must be paid in full before leaving our business.

Buyer will be provided a temporary license plate that gives the buyer 21 days to register the vehicle. We reserve the right of the full 21 days to provide you with a title. We do not

send titles to the buyer until paperwork is signed and in our possession.<br /> <br /> We are not responsible for mistakes in the ad. We are only human and occasionally make an

unintentional mistake. Please call or email to have any and all questions about the vehicle you are bidding on answered before you commit to purchasing.<br /> <br /> All vehicles

are sold in accordance with the laws of Florida in the jurisdiction of Palm Beach County.<br /> ANY QUESTIONS PLEASE CALL 561-318-3980<br /> <br /> If you are financing the

vehicle, please have it pre-approved before bidding. We can help locate possible financing options.<br /> <br /> Once you bid you are entering a legal and binding contract to

purchase the vehicle described. There are no bid retractions accepted within the final 24 hours of the auction.<br /> <br /> We will not accept shill-bidding, bidders with excessive

negative feedbacks, or unqualified bidders.<br /> <br /> Cars Cars Cars DBA &quot;The Palm Beach Collection&quot; reserves the right to cancel our auctions early for any reason

at any time.<br /> <br /> Please make sure all your questions are answered before bidding.<br /> <br /> If you are unsure about the color of a vehicle, please use the VIN and call

your local dealer for more specifics.<br /> <br /> We accept money orders, cashiers checks, or wire transfers as forms of payment. We reserve the right to hold the title until cashiers

checks clear our bank (5 to 7 days). We do not exchange a check for a title.<br /> <br /> If the vehicle is to be registered in the state of Florida the buyer must add all applicable sales

tax and licensing fees to the final auction price. Out of state buyers who wish to pick up the vehicle and drive it home may have to pay their states sales tax through the state of

Florida. Call us for details.<br /> <br /> We require a $500 non refundable deposit within 48 hours of the auction ending. If the buyer cannot pay the balance in full within 7-days we

Passenger Side 2nd Row
Fixed Window, Rear Right

Fixed Window, Storage
Compartment w/Rear Door
Nets, Driver Side 2nd Row

Fixed Window, Rear Left Fixed
Window

$11,438

-  

Option Packages Total



can make special &quot;Delayed Payment Arrangements.&quot; Delayed Payment Arrangements MUST be requested &amp; approved by seller prior to bidding.<br /> <br /> The

buyer is responsible for shipping arrangements and costs. Occasionally we can help arrange shipping.<br /> <br /> Some of the automobiles we offer are still under Manufacturers

Warranty Factory Warranty. In all other cases cars are sold &quot;AS/IS&quot; unless otherwise noted.<br /> <br /> We do not accept escrow services. The vehicle must be paid in

full before leaving our business. In some instances buyer may be provided a temporary license plate that gives the buyer 30 days to register the vehicle.&nbsp; We do not send titles

to the buyer until paperwork is signed and in our possession.<br /> <br /> We are not responsible for mistakes in the ad. We are only human and occasionally make an unintentional

mistake. Please call or email to have any and all questions about the vehicle you are bidding on answered before you commit to purchasing.<br /> <br /> All vehicles are sold in

accordance with the laws of Florida in the jurisdiction of Palm Beach County.<br /> ANY QUESTIONS PLEASE CALL 561-318-3980<br /> <br /> If you are financing the vehicle,

please have it pre-approved before bidding. We can help locate possible financing options.<br /> <br /> Once you bid you are entering a legal and binding contract to purchase the

vehicle described. There are no bid retractions accepted within the final 24 hours of the auction.<br /> <br /> We will not accept shill-bidding, bidders with excessive negative

feedbacks, or unqualified bidders.<br /> <br /> Cars Cars Cars DBA &quot;The Palm Beach Collection&quot; reserves the right to cancel our auctions early for any reason at any

time.<br /> <br /> Please make sure all your questions are answered before bidding.<br /> <br /> If you are unsure about the color of a vehicle, please use the VIN and call your local

dealer for more specifics.<br /> <br /> We accept money orders, cashiers checks, or wire transfers as forms of payment. We reserve the right to hold the title until cashiers checks

clear our bank (5 to 7 days). We do not exchange a check for a title.<br /> <br /> If the vehicle is to be registered in the state of Florida the buyer must add all applicable sales tax

and licensing fees to the final auction price. Out of state buyers who wish to pick up the vehicle and drive it home may have to pay their states sales tax through the state of Florida.

Call us for details.<br /> <br /> We require a $500 non refundable deposit within 48 hours of the auction ending. If the buyer cannot pay the balance in full within 7-days we can

make special &quot;Delayed Payment Arrangements.&quot; Delayed Payment Arrangements MUST be requested &amp; approved by seller prior to bidding.<br /> <br /> The buyer

is responsible for shipping arrangements and costs. Occasionally we can help arrange shipping.<br /> <br /> Some of the automobiles we offer are still under Manufacturers

Warranty Factory Warranty. In all other cases cars are sold &quot;AS/IS&quot; unless otherwise noted.<br /> <br /> We do not accept escrow services. The vehicle must be paid in

full before leaving our business. Buyer will be provided a temporary license plate that gives the buyer 21 days to register the vehicle. We reserve the right of the full 21 days to

provide you with a title. We do not send titles to the buyer until paperwork is signed and in our possession.<br /> <br /> We are not responsible for mistakes in the ad. We are only

human and occasionally make an unintentional mistake. Please call or email to have any and all questions about the vehicle you are bidding on answered before you commit to

purchasing.<br /> <br /> All vehicles are sold in accordance with the laws of Florida in the jurisdiction of Palm Beach County.<br /> ANY QUESTIONS PLEASE CALL 561-318-

3980<br /> <br /> If you are financing the vehicle, please have it pre-approved before bidding. We can help locate possible financing options.<br /> <br /> Once you bid you are

entering a legal and binding contract to purchase the vehicle described. There are no bid retractions accepted within the final 24 hours of the auction.<br /> <br /> We will not accept

shill-bidding, bidders with excessive negative feedbacks, or unqualified bidders.<br /> <br /> Cars Cars Cars DBA &quot;The Palm Beach Collection&quot; reserves the right to

cancel our auctions early for any reason at any time.<br /> <br /> Please make sure all your questions are answered before bidding.<br /> <br /> If you are unsure about the color of a

vehicle, please use the VIN and call your local dealer for more specifics.<br /> <br /> We accept money orders, cashiers checks, or wire transfers as forms of payment. We reserve

the right to hold the title until cashiers checks clear our bank (5 to 7 days). We do not exchange a check for a title.<br /> <br /> If the vehicle is to be registered in the state of Florida

the buyer must add all applicable sales tax and licensing fees to the final auction price. Out of state buyers who wish to pick up the vehicle and drive it home may have to pay their

states sales tax through the state of Florida. Call us for details.<br /> <br /> We require a $500 non refundable deposit within 48 hours of the auction ending. If the buyer cannot pay

the balance in full within 7-days we can make special &quot;Delayed Payment Arrangements.&quot; Delayed Payment Arrangements MUST be requested &amp; approved by seller

prior to bidding.<br /> <br /> The buyer is responsible for shipping arrangements and costs. Occasionally we can help arrange shipping.<br /> <br /> Some of the automobiles we

offer are still under Manufacturers Warranty Factory Warranty. In all other cases cars are sold &quot;AS/IS&quot; unless otherwise noted.<br /> <br /> We do not accept escrow

services. The vehicle must be paid in full before leaving our business. Buyer will be provided a temporary license plate that gives the buyer 21 days to register the vehicle. We

reserve the right of the full 21 days to provide you with a title. We do not send titles to the buyer until paperwork is signed and in our possession.<br /> <br /> We are not responsible

for mistakes in the ad. We are only human and occasionally make an unintentional mistake. Please call or email to have any and all questions about the vehicle you are bidding on

answered before you commit to purchasing.<br /> <br /> All vehicles are sold in accordance with the laws of Florida in the jurisdiction of Palm Beach County.<br /> ANY

QUESTIONS PLEASE CALL 561-318-3980

The Palm Beach Collection
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